

APPLICATION 16-08-006  
ALLIANCE FOR NUCLEAR RESPONSIBILITY  
INTERVENOR COMPENSATION CLAIM

**ATTACHMENT 3. Appendix – Time Sheet Records and Allocation of Hours by Issue in  
A.14-02-008 and A.15-02-023**

**A.14-02-008 TIME RECORDS OF JOHN GEESMAN**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>ACTIVITY</u>	<u>IPRP</u>	<u>JT. RUPT.</u>	<u>CZMA</u>	<u>OTHER</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
4/6/2016	correspondence w. clients re: RCE impact on schedule for PD				0.02	0.02
3/18/2016	correspondence w. clients re: paleoseismic research offshore			0.05		0.05
3/12/2016	correspondence w. clients re: DRA				0.05	0.05
3/11/2016	correspondence w. clients re: DRA				0.02	0.02
3/2/2016	correspondence w. clients re: change to statutory deadline, potential PD				0.06	0.06
11/24/2015	correspondence w. clients re: schedule for PD				0.1	0.1
11/12/2015	draft Notice of Ex Parte Communication				0.08	0.08
11/2/2015	review joint PG&E/ORA motion				0.05	0.05
9/16/2015	review PG&E Notice of Communication				0.02	0.02
5/21/2015	correspondence w. Kately, van Derbecken re: PG&E Notice of Improper Contact				0.04	0.04
5/21/2015	review PG&E Notice of Improper Contact				0.02	0.02
1/15/2015	correspondence w. clients re: schedule for PD				0.02	0.02
11/26/2014	correspondence w. clients re: timeframe for CPUC decision				0.02	0.02
10/17/2014	read PG&E Reply Brief	0.1	0.1	0.1		0.3
10/10/2014	draft Reply Brief	1.56	1.56	1.55		4.67
10/9/2014	draft Reply Brief	2.2	2.19	2.19		6.58
10/4/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E "no excuses" reply to OSC				0.05	0.05
10/3/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E Opening Brief, ground motion modeling, IPRP, A4NR Opening Brief, Hamilton and relicensing proceeding, USGS on observational studies	0.1	0.1	0.1		0.3
10/3/2014	read PG&E Opening Brief	0.23	0.22	0.22		0.67
10/3/2014	correspondence w. CEC re: Opening Brief	0.02				0.02
10/2/2014	finalize Opening Brief	0.25	0.25	0.25		0.75
10/1/2014	correspondence w. clients re: SCEC seismicity approach		0.03	0.02		0.05
10/1/2014	meeting w. clients to debrief from meetings w. state agencies	0.45	0.44	0.44		1.33
10/1/2014	meeting w. Energy Division staff, clients	0.2	0.19	0.19		0.58
10/1/2014	meeting w. CCC staff, clients	0.33	0.33	0.34		1
10/1/2014	correspondence w. CEC re: meeting				0.02	0.02
9/30/2014	meeting w. CEC staff	0.34	0.33	0.33		1
9/30/2014	meeting w. Resources Agency staff	0.33	0.34	0.33		1
9/26/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E seismic event in SLO	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
9/25/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Sewell and DCISC, Peck, Opening brief, briefing schedule and response to Klimczak	0.08	0.07	0.07		0.22

9/25/2014	correspondence w. ORA re: briefing schedule				0.05	0.05
9/24/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Klimczak statements about transparency	0.03	0.03	0.02		0.08
9/23/2014	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP strategy, Opening Brief	0.07	0.06	0.06		0.19
9/22/2014	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP, Opening Brief	0.05	0.05	0.05		0.15
9/22/2014	phone call w. Roe re: proactive regulation	0.17	0.17	0.16		0.5
9/22/2014	draft Opening Brief	1.8	1.8	1.8		5.4
9/22/2014	correspondence w. Roe re: phone call				0.02	0.02
9/21/2014	correspondence w. Roe re: his writeup	0.11	0.11	0.11		0.33
9/20/2014	correspondence w. Roe re: his writeup				0.02	0.02
9/20/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton critique, IPRP #6, deficiencies in PG&E seismic studies, NRC staff response, CPUC staff meeting, Sandoval	0.12	0.11	0.11		0.34
9/20/2014	review NRC staff response to receipt of PG&E seismic studies	0.06	0.06	0.05		0.17
9/19/2014	draft Opening Brief	2.06	2.05	2.05		6.16
9/19/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Bryan Cherry, Halpin letter contradictions, potential AG investigation, IPRP, PG&E/NRC simultaneous announcements	0.14	0.14	0.13		0.41
9/18/2014	draft Opening Brief	1.23	1.22	1.22		3.67
9/18/2014	correspondence w. clients re: misstatements in Halpin letter, update to ASLB from PG&E	0.09	0.09	0.09		0.27
9/18/2014	correspondence w. CAISO re: comments on AC/ALJ order	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
9/17/2014	draft Opening Brief	2.38	2.37	2.37		7.12
9/17/2014	correspondence w. clients re: WBA, HECA, PG&E dividend	0.05	0.05	0.04		0.14
9/16/2014	correspondence w. clients re: CPUC turmoil, Peck, Nelson, special interest allegation, potential PG&E criminal liability	0.19	0.19	0.19		0.57
9/16/2014	draft Opening Brief	2.05	2.04	2.04		6.13
9/16/2014	review Peck's written response to DPO denial		0.68			0.68
9/16/2014	correspondence w. Roe re: PG&E conduct	0.18	0.18	0.17		0.53
9/15/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E ex parte notice, Rule 8.4(f), Ken Salazar, advice letter on LTSP, PG&E misconduct, Peck DPO	0.2	0.21	0.2		0.61
9/15/2014	review PG&E ex parte notice w. attached emails	0.1	0.09	0.09		0.28
9/15/2014	draft Opening Brief	1.98	1.98	1.98		5.94
9/15/2014	correspondence w. CEC staff re: PG&E emails	0.02	0.01	0.01		0.04
9/15/2014	correspondence w. IEP re: PG&E emails	0.02	0.01	0.01		0.04
9/15/2014	correspondence w. Malcolm re: PG&E emails	0.02	0.01	0.01		0.04
9/14/2014	review Peck DPO materials		3.72			3.72
9/14/2014	draft Opening Brief	1.11	1.11	1.11		3.33

9/13/2014	draft Opening Brief	0.96	0.96	0.95		2.87
9/12/2014	draft Opening Brief	1.82	1.82	1.81		5.45
9/11/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Halpin's description of studies, meeting w. Energy Division and CCC	0.04	0.03	0.03		0.1
9/10/2014	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP expectations, Sartorius and Peck, Neil Driscoll, timing of PG&E release w. NRC denial of Peck DPO, Jane Swanson, Bruce Gibson, DCISC Sewell FOIA	0.16	0.16	0.15		0.47
9/9/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton, Diablo Cove, different recurrence periods for Hosgri and Shoreline, Sewell report	0.13	0.14	0.13		0.4
9/8/2014	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP, PG&E timing of decision on relicensing, Klimczak cross, Hamilton and Hardebeck response, reactions to PG&E early release	0.22	0.21	0.21		0.64
9/7/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Nader	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
9/6/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Cluff and Womack video, ORA issue of weld/arc problem	0.07	0.07	0.07		0.21
9/6/2014	review PG&E video of Cluff and Womack on DCNPP seismicity	0.34	0.33	0.33		1
9/5/2014	correspondence w. clients re: briefing strategy, Klimczak cross, CPUC issue in gubernatorial debate	0.11	0.11	0.1		0.32
9/4/2014	participate in evidentiary hearing	1.89	1.89	1.89		5.67
9/4/2014	email w. ALJ Roscow re: A4NR witness presence at hearing				0.04	0.04
9/3/2014	correspondence w. clients re: hearings, cross-examination	0.03	0.03	0.03		0.09
9/3/2014	preparation of cross-examination exhibits	0.84	0.83	0.83		2.5
9/3/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: cross-examination exhibits				0.02	0.02
9/3/2014	read ALJ Roscow's rulings on A4NR motions	0.11	0.11	0.11		0.33
9/2/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton cross-examination, PG&E emails from GRC testimony, San Bruno rulings	0.03	0.03	0.03		0.09
9/2/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: cross-examination exhibits				0.1	0.1
9/2/2014	read ORA emails on cross-examination and briefing				0.02	0.02
9/2/2014	read ALJ Roscow's email on hearing				0.02	0.02
9/2/2014	review PG&E emails from GRC testimony appendices	0.34	0.33	0.33		1
9/2/2014	preparation of cross-examination	0.86	0.86	0.85		2.57
9/1/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Sewell and Budnitz	0.04		0.04		0.08
8/29/2014	correspondence w. PG&E, ORA re: briefing schedule				0.03	0.03
8/29/2014	correspondence w. clients re: cross-examination, PG&E's August assurance to ASLB on timing of "final" report, DCISC, Peck, Lutz	0.05	0.04	0.04		0.13
8/28/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: cross-examination, stipulated admission of docs				0.07	0.07

8/28/2014	correspondence w. clients re: importance of damping in ground motion response, simplicity of damping vs. complexity of tau	0.1	0.1	0.1		0.3
8/27/2014	correspondence w. clients re: cross-examination				0.02	0.02
8/27/2014	read ALJ Roscow's emails on rulings and hearings				0.03	0.03
8/26/2014	correspondence w. clients re: FOE/Peck/NRC FOIA materials, PG&E post-Napa response, timing of PG&E "final" report	0.06	0.07	0.06		0.19
8/26/2014	read FOE petition, Peck DPO, and NRC FOIA materials		2.11			2.11
8/26/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: stipulation to admission of exhibits				0.1	0.1
8/25/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Peck DPO, seismic PRA vs. embrittlement PRA	0.05	0.05	0.05		0.15
8/25/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: A4NR-0563				0.02	0.02
8/24/2014	correspondence w. clients re: CGS fault maps	0.02				0.02
8/22/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	1.7	1.69	1.69		5.08
8/22/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: A4NR-0563				0.05	0.05
8/22/2014	read ALJ Roscow's response to request for rulings				0.02	0.02
8/21/2014	correspondence w. clients re: strategy for hearings, PG&E response to Sewell	0.14	0.14	0.14		0.42
8/21/2014	listen to archived PG&E interview re: GRC and San Bruno	0.17	0.17	0.16		0.5
8/21/2014	correspondence w. ALJ Roscow requesting rulings on A4NR motions				0.05	0.05
8/19/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	1.4	1.39	1.39		4.18
8/19/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Gunderson report	0.04	0.03	0.03		0.1
8/19/2014	review Arne Gunderson report on DCNPP seismic issues	0.45	0.45	0.45		1.35
8/18/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Shoreline Fault	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
8/18/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	2.06	2.05	2.05		6.16
8/15/2014	correspondence w. clients re: proprietary documents log	0.12	0.12	0.11		0.35
8/15/2014	review proprietary documents in PG&E data responses	0.29	0.28	0.28		0.85
8/14/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E data responses, impact of criminal indictment on NRC license	0.03	0.02	0.02		0.07
8/14/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: cross-examination estimates				0.03	0.03
8/12/2014	review NRC seismic inspection report	0.08	0.07	0.07		0.22
8/11/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Sewell report	0.04		0.04		0.08
8/7/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Sewell report, Wetch vs. Klimczak estimates for "final" report	0.02	0.02	0.03		0.07
8/7/2014	correspondence w. CEC re; Sewell report	0.03		0.02		0.05
8/5/2014	correspondence w. clients re: lawsuit against PG&E execs	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03

8/4/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: supplemental data requests	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.03
8/4/2014	phone call w. PG&E re: supplemental data requests	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.17
8/1/2014	correspondence w. clients re: DCISC video	0.02			0.02
8/1/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: discovery call	0.01		0.01	0.02
7/31/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton, Gibson, Blakeslee, PG&E private meetings w. IPRP	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.3
7/31/2014	draft data requests to PG&E based on rebuttal testimony	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.22
7/30/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Gibson and Blakeslee reactions to PG&E treatment of IPRP	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.27
7/27/2014	correspondence w. clients re: discussions w. Bruce Gibson	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.17
7/26/2014	review PG&E rebuttal testimony	0.36	0.36	0.35	1.07
7/26/2014	correspondence w. clients re: discovery strategy on rebuttal testimony	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.17
7/25/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E rebuttal testimony, NAS report and UCS critique	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.12
7/25/2014	review National Academies Fukushima Lessons Learned report and UCS critique for cross-examination ideas	0.64	0.64	0.64	1.92
7/24/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee meetings vs. letter	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
7/22/2014	correspondence e. clients re: Blakeslee letter	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
7/18/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Sewell and DCISC, Peck, Opening	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
7/16/2014	draft/transmit response to PG&E's first data requests	0.3	0.29	0.29	0.88
7/16/2014	correspondence w. clients re: value of two NRC "refutals" of Sewell, PG&E-induced slippage in "final" report schedule	0.03	0.03	0.04	0.1
7/14/2014	assemble/transmit responses to PG&E's second data requests	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
7/14/2014	correspondence w. clients re: responses to data requests	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.07
7/10/2014	correspondence w. clients re: responses to data requests	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
7/10/2014	review PG&E's second data requests	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
7/9/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E July 8 update to NRC	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
7/9/2014	review PG&E July 8 update to NRC	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
7/9/2014	review NRC July 3 letter to Halpin	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
7/8/2014	correspondence w. clients re: responses to data requests	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
7/8/2014	review PG&E data requests and plan response	0.26	0.26	0.26	0.78
7/7/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Peck's response to NRC suppression of Sewell report			0.02	0.02
7/2/2014	correspondence w. CPUC re: response to PRA request	0.08			0.08
7/1/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E redacted data responses	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.08
7/1/2014	voicemail to PG&E re: lifting seal on testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.03
6/27/2014	draft Reply to PG&E Response to Motion to Compel	0.99	0.98	0.98	2.95

6/25/2014 draft Reply to PG&E Response to Motion to Compel	1.97	1.97	1.96	5.9
6/25/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee letter	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
6/24/2014 draft Reply to PG&E Response to Motion to Compel	2.19	2.19	2.19	6.57
6/24/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Sewell reaction to NRC	0.05		0.05	0.1
6/23/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Sewell, tsunami walkdown numbers, PG&E Response to Motion to Compel, delay of "final" seismic report, Blakeslee letter	0.13	0.13	0.12	0.38
6/23/2014 draft Reply to PG&E Response to Motion to Compel	1.31	1.3	1.3	3.91
6/23/2014 correspondence w. Dan Richard re: ASLB reaction to PG&E footdragging	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.03
6/23/2014 research California law on attorney-client and attorney work product privileges	0.92	0.92	0.91	2.75
6/23/2014 phone call w. ALJ Roscow re: opportunity to reply to PG&E Response to Motion to Compel	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
6/22/2014 draft potential Blakeslee letter on IPRP and Sewell	0.5	0.5	0.5	1.5
6/22/2014 correspondence w. clients re: testimony	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
6/20/2014 correspondence w. PG&E re: NDA and unredacted testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.03
6/20/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton and Geesman testimony, PG&E Response to Motion to Compel, Blakeslee letter	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.15
6/20/2014 review Hamilton testimony and exhibits	0.22	0.22	0.22	0.66
6/20/2014 review PG&E Response to Motion to Compel	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
6/19/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Peevey, Florio, strategy for Sewell report, PG&E delay letter to ASLB, Hamilton testimony	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.17
6/19/2014 review/edit four separate drafts of Hamilton testimony	0.87	0.86	0.86	2.59
6/19/2014 review PG&E June update letter to ASLB	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
6/19/2014 draft motion to unseal testimony	0.41	0.41	0.4	1.22
6/18/2014 correspondence w. clients re: PRA request	0.03			0.03
6/18/2014 draft PRA request for Energy Division staff emails on IPRP	0.25			0.25
6/18/2014 draft NOI***				0.67 ***@50% of hourly rate
6/18/2014 correspondence w. PG&E re: withdrawal of confidentiality designation	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
6/17/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Geesman testimony	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
6/17/2014 correspondence w. PG&E re: lifting confidentiality designation on portions of two documents	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
6/16/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton testimony	0.01	0.01		0.02
6/15/2017 correspondence w. clients re: Sewell report and raising profile of tsunami issues	0.35		0.34	0.69

6/14/2017	edit/revise Geesman testimony	1.75	1.75	1.75	5.25
6/14/2017	research Sewell tsunami report documents	0.39		0.38	0.77
6/13/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: doc #299	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
6/13/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Budnitz and tsunami study	0.03		0.02	0.05
6/13/2014	meet and confer call w. PG&E	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
6/10/2014	draft Motion to Compel	1.33	1.33	1.32	3.98
6/9/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Nishenko approach to IPRP #6, Hamilton testimony,	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.22
6/9/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: discovery response				0.02
6/9/2014	draft Motion to Compel	1.05	1.04	1.04	3.13
6/9/2014	research attorney-client privilege	0.81	0.81	0.81	2.43
6/9/2014	meet and confer call w. PG&E on privilege log conflicts	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.75
6/9/2014	prepare for meet and confer call	0.2	0.19	0.19	0.58
6/8/2014	correspondence w. clients re: meet and confer call, Arne Gunderson, cognitive bias of Bill Lettis	0.05	0.05	0.04	0.14
6/7/2014	review outline of Hamilton testimony	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
6/6/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton testimony, Arne Gunderson, cognitive bias of Bill Lettis	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
6/6/2014	review revised PG&E privilege log	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.2
6/5/2014	draft Geesman testimony	1.21	1.21	1.2	3.62
6/5/2014	research attorney-client privilege	1.09	1.08	1.08	3.25
6/5/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re; privilege log	0.26	0.26	0.25	0.77
6/4/2014	review Florio scoping memo	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.22
6/4/2014	draft Geesman testimony	2.73	2.73	2.73	8.19
6/3/2014	draft Geesman testimony	2.54	2.53	2.53	7.6
6/3/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton testimony, inquiry from earthquake expert	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.27
6/2/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	2.66	2.66	2.65	7.97
6/1/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	2.67	2.67	2.66	8
5/30/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton testimony	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
5/28/2014	correspondence w. clients re: CPUC budget materials for IPRP, PG&E discovery responses, Abrahamson on transparency	0.07	0.06	0.06	0.19
5/27/2014	correspondence w. clients re: FOE filing, MFP meeting	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
5/25/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	0.34	0.33	0.33	1
5/24/2014	correspondence w. clients re: data points for ground motion	0.03			0.03
5/24/2014	review PG&E discovery responses	3.17	3.16	3.16	9.49
5/23/2014	correspondence w. clients re: potential Blakeslee letter explaining AB 1632	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1



5/22/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Magwood visit & IPRP meeting	0.02				0.02
5/21/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee letter	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.12
5/21/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: data requests				0.02	0.02
5/20/2014	review PG&E's proposed NDA	0.21	0.21	0.2		0.62
5/19/2014	attend PHC	0.31	0.3	0.3		0.91
5/18/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E discovery responses	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
5/17/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Jearl Strickland video on seismic studies	0.04	0.03	0.03		0.1
5/16/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PHC	0.01	0.01			0.02
5/15/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Peck		0.03			0.03
5/15/2014	review ALJ ruling granting LMUD party status				0.1	0.1
5/14/2014	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP mtg., tsunami studies and NRC, NRC inquiry on seismic, Hamilton input,	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.12
5/9/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E discovery responses	0.05	0.04	0.04		0.13
5/8/2014	meet and confer w. PG&E	0.1	0.1	0.09		0.29
5/8/2014	correspondence w. clients re: confidential documents	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
5/7/2014	review PG&E-proposed NDA	0.09	0.08	0.08		0.25
5/6/2014	correspondence w. clients re: initial PG&E data responses	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
5/5/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PHC, PG&E data responses	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
5/1/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PHC, PG&E data responses, FOE and Hamilton, role of NRC resident inspectors on seismic	0.06	0.06	0.06		0.18
4/29/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Bruce Gibson and IPRP	0.05				0.05
4/28/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Bruce Gibson and IPRP	0.02				0.02
4/25/2014	read ALJ Roscow's email re: PHC and schedule				0.02	0.02
4/23/2014	correspondence w. clients re: CPUC staff and IPRP meeting, discovery from IPRP, PG&E June report to NRC, PHC	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.12
4/22/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E June report to NRC, Sebrosky letter, FOE, prospective Hamilton testimony, PHC	0.07	0.06	0.06		0.19
4/22/2014	review PG&E April 17 report to ASLB	0.09	0.08	0.08		0.25
4/22/2014	review party emails on PHC dates				0.08	0.08
4/22/2014	correspondence w. PG&E re: PHC dates				0.03	0.03
4/21/2014	draft first round data requests to PG&E	0.5	0.49	0.49		1.48
4/16/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E arraignment		0.01	0.01		0.02
4/14/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E response to Protest, PG&E arraignment	0.03	0.03	0.03		0.09
4/14/2014	read PG&E Response to Proteswt	0.14	0.13	0.13		0.4
4/10/2014	correspondence w. clients re: DCISC video, PG&E indictment	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.12
4/8/2014	read ORA Protest	0.09	0.08	0.08		0.25

4/3/2014 mtg. w. clients, Lochbaum, CEC staff	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.75
4/3/2014 mtg. w. clients, Lochbaum, CCC staff	0.34	0.33	0.33	1
4/2/2014 correspondence w. clients re: state agency interest in Protest	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
4/1/2014 correspondence w. clients re: seismic parallel to PG&E criminal indictments, Protest,	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.07
4/1/2014 review PG&E criminal indictment	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
3/31/2014 finalize Protest	0.14	0.14	0.14	0.42
3/28/2014 correspondence w. clients re: seismic parallel to PG&E indictments	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.1
3/27/2014 drive from SLO to Orinda after attending SSC SSHAC***	1.34	1.33	1.33	4 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
3/27/2014 attend SSC SSHAC	2.6	2.6	2.6	7.8
3/26/2014 attend SSC SSHAC	3.17	3.17	3.16	9.5
3/25/2014 attend SSC SSHAC	3.17	3.17	3.16	9.5
3/24/2014 mtg. w. Douglas Hamilton to discuss discovery, testimony	0.5	0.5	0.5	1.5
3/24/2014 drive from Orinda to SLO to attend SSC SSHAC	1.34	1.33	1.33	4 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
3/24/2014 correspondence w. clients re: SSC SSHAC		0.02		0.02
3/21/2014 correspondence w. clients re: draft Protest, SSC SSHAC, Hamilton response to Fallin sole fault hypothesis, MFP seismic archive	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.2
3/21/2014 draft Protest	0.69	0.69	0.69	2.07
3/20/2014 draft Protest	1.08	1.07	1.07	3.22
3/18/2014 draft Protest	1.44	1.44	1.43	4.31
3/18/2014 correspondence w. clients re: sole fault hypothesis		0.02		0.02
3/18/2014 review NRC dockets for 2013 PG&E seismic communications	0.92	0.92	0.91	2.75
3/17/2014 correspondence w. clients re: materials for SSC SSHAC attendees	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.15
3/17/2014 draft Protest	2.25	2.25	2.25	6.75
3/14/2017 review PG&E 2013 ASLB and 10-Q filings	0.89	0.89	0.88	2.66
3/14/2014 correspondence w. clients re: carryover evidence for 2012 ERRAs	0.02			0.02
3/14/2014 review D.12-09-008	0.45	0.45	0.45	1.35
3/14/2014 review 2012 ERRAs briefs and testimony for carryover evidence	1.29	1.29	1.29	3.87
3/13/2014 review Commission decisions on protests, ERRAs compliance	0.48	0.47	0.47	1.42
3/7/2014 read PG&E testimony, application	0.54	0.54	0.54	1.62
3/7/2014 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E testimony, ERRAs forum for seismic studies	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.09
3/7/2014 correspondence w. PG&E re: requesting copies of testimony	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05
3/4/2014 correspondence w. clients, Hamilton re: Chapter 6 of filing	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.05

3/4/2014 review Chapter 6 of filing	0.18	0.17	0.17		0.52
2/28/2014 correspondence w. clients re: intervention in case	0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
<b>Totals</b>	97.56	101.96	95.7	2.22	297.44

**A.14-02-008 TIME RECORDS OF ROCHELLE BECKER**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>IPRP</b>	<b>JT. RUPT.</b>	<b>CZMA</b>	<b>OTHER</b>
2/28/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff intervention in upcoming ERRA	0.02		0.02	
3/4/2014	Review Chap 6	0.13		0.14	
3/7/2014	Read PGE testimony - seismic	0.6		0.45	
3/26/2014	Attend SSC SSHAC in SLO	3.17	3.17	3.16	
3/27/2014	Attend SSC SSHAC in SLO	3.17	3.17	3.16	
3/28/2014	emails atty/staff seismic parallel PG&E indictments	2.6	2.6	2.6	
3/31/2014	Review and edit final draft of A4NR Protest	0.04	0.03	0.03	
4/1/2014	Review PGE criminal indictment	0.07	0.07	0.07	
4/2/2014	Correspondence atty/client re: state interest in Protest	0.02	0.02	0.01	
4/3/2014	mtg. with atty/staff/UCS (Lochbaum) and CCC staff	0.34	0.33	0.33	
4/3/2014	mtg with atty/staff/UCS/CEC staff	0.25	0.25	0.25	
4/8/2014	read ORA protest seismic only	0.07	0.05	0.07	
4/10/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re DCISC video/PGE indictment	0.04	0.04	0.04	
4/14/2014	Read PG&E Response to Protest	0.04	0.02	0.03	
4/14/2014	review with atty/staff re: PG&E Response &arraignment	0.03	0.03	0.03	
4/19/2014	review PGE 4/17 Report to ASLB	0.07		0.07	
4/21/2014	review first round of A4NR data requests	0.04	0.03	0.04	
4/22/2014	review comments on PHC dates				0.06
5/5/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff PHC< PGE data resp,	0.02	0.02	0.01	
5/8/2014	email atty/staff re: confidential docs	0.02	0.02	0.01	
5/9/2014	email atty/staff re: PGE discovery responses	0.05	0.04	0.04	
5/18/2014	Correspondence w atty/staff PG&E discover responses	0.02	0.02	0.01	
5/21/2014	email with atty/staff re: Blakeslee ltr	0.04	0.04	0.04	
5/27/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re: FOE fiing MFP meeting	0.02	0.02	0.01	
6/4/2014	review Comm Florio Scoping memo	0.04	0.02	0.03	
6/10/2014	Review and approve A4NR Motion to Compel	0.03	0.02	0.03	
6/14/2014	review Geesman draft testimony	0.7	0.04	0.5	
6/19/2014	review PG&E June update to ASLB	0.03	0.01	0.02	
6/26/2014	email exchange with Blakeslee re docs for testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01	
6/27/2014	review and approve A4NR reply to PG&E Resp to Motion to Compel				
7/1/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re: redacted data responses	0.03	0.03	0.02	
7/1/2014	email exchange A4NR staff re: Blakeslee testimony timing				0.1
7/9/2014	emails with atty/staffLochbaum PG&E update to NRC	0.02	0.02	0.01	
7/10/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re: responses to data reqs	0.04	0.03	0.03	
7/14/2014	email with atty/staff re: response to data reqs	0.03	0.02	0.02	
7/16/2014	email atty/client re NRC Sewell slippage	0.03	0.03	0.04	

7/25/2014	Review NAS Lessons learned and UCS critic on Fukushima	0.45	0.3	0.4		
7/25/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re: PGE rebuttal, NAS and UCS	0.04	0.04	0.04		
7/26/2014	emails atty/staff re discovery stragey rebuttal test	0.06	0.06	0.06		
7/30/2014	email atty/staff re: Hamilton, Gibson, Blakeslee, IPRP, PGE	0.01	0.01	0.01		
8/12/2014	review NRC seismic inspection rept	0.02		0.02		
8/14/2014	email with atty/staff re: PGE data resp, impact of PGE indict NRC Lic	0.03	0.03	0.02		
8/19/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re: Gunderson rept	0.04	0.04	0.03		
9/1/2014	Correspondence with atty/staff re: Sewell and Budnitz				0.03	
9/2/2014	Read ALJ Roscow's email on hearing				0.02	
9/3/2014	Read ALJ's ruling on A4NR motions	0.09		0.11		
9/4/2014	participate in evidentiary hearing with atty-experts	1.89	1.89	1.89		
9/5/2014	TRAVEL from SFO to SAN post 09/04/14 evidentiary hearing				1.5	
9/8/2014	email atty/staff re:IPRP, PG&E timing on lic renewal	0.22	0.21	0.22		
9/11/2014	email atty/staff re: IPRP, experts, NRC denial of Peck, DCISC, FOIA	0.16	0.16	0.15		
9/25/2014	emails with atty to discuss briefing schedule				0.01	
10/1/2014	Meet with Energy Division with atty staff	0.33	0.33	0.34		
10/3/2014	review PG&E opening brief	0.2		0.23		
10/4/2014	review ORA Open Brief re: seismic					
10/10/2014	review(and approve) A4NR Reply draft re: seismic					
10/17/2014	Review PG&E Reply brief	0.15		0.2	0.1	
11/26/2014	email RB DJW (13) SSHAC notes, IPRP, seismic CPUC decision timing				0.02	
	<b>Totals ROCHELLE BECKER (2014)</b>	<b>15.52</b>	<b>13.27</b>	<b>15.05</b>	<b>1.84</b>	<b>45.68</b>
	<b>Travel Hours</b>				<b>1.5</b>	

**A.14-02-008 TIME RECORDS OF DAVID WEISMAN**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Task</b>	<b>IPRP</b>	<b>JT. RUPT.</b>	<b>CZMA</b>	<b>OTHER</b>
03/04/14	review Chapter 6 of ERRA filing	0.18	0.17	0.17	
03/07/14	read PG&E testimony, application	0.4	0.4	0.4	
03/24/14	mtg. w/ Dr. Hamilton to discuss discovery, testimony	0.5	0.5	0.5	
03/25/14	Attend Seismic Source Characterization SSC SSHAC meeting in SLO	3.17	3.17	3.16	
03/26/17	Attend Seismic Source Characterization SSC SSHAC meeting in SLO	3.17	3.17	3.16	
03/27/14	Attend Seismic Source Characterization SSC SSHAC meeting in SLO	2.6	2.6	2.6	
03/28/14	email from Geesman: contact Hamilton re: prepare Testimony				0.05
03/31/14	review & proofread A4NR protest in ERRA-008	0.15	0.1	0.1	
04/02/14	TRAVEL SLO-SJC to San Francisco meetings with CCC and CEC				4
04/03/14	mtg. w. clients, Lochbaum, CCC staff	0.34	0.33	0.33	
04/03/14	mtg. w. clients, Lochbaum, CEC staff	0.25	0.25	0.25	
04/04/14	TRAVEL SJC-SLO from San Francisco meetings with CCC and CEC				4
04/08/14	review ORA protest	0.05	0.05	0.05	
04/14/14	read PG&E Response to Protest	0.1	0.1	0.1	
04/21/14	review and proofread A4NR Data Requests #1	0.1	0.1	0.1	
04/22/14	review PG&E report to ASLB re: seismic review dated 4/17	0.06	0.06	0.06	
04/23/14	review Geesman emails re: CPUC staff, IPRP meeting, PGE NRC report	0.02	0.02	0.02	
05/01/14	remail to Geesman re: Dr. Hamilton upcoming testimony considerations	0.05	0.05		
05/08/14	review Geesman email re: NDA				0.02
05/09/14	email from Geesman: data requests emails from PGE + log				0.03
05/14/14	email from Geesman: IPRP meeting scheduled + Dr. Hamilton role	0.01	0.03		
05/16/14	download and email Strickland video clips on seismic study to legal team	0.03	0.03	0.03	
05/21/14	email from Geesman re: Dr. Blakeslee letters	0.01	0.01		
05/23/15	download + prepare video excerpt of SSHAC appearances for Hamilton	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3
05/23/14	email from Geesman re: Sam Blakeslee and IPRP per AB 1632	0.02	0.02		
05/27/14	prepare outline for Hamilton testimony; determine research needs	1	1		
05/30/14	email w/Geesman re: Hamilton testimony	0.04	0.04	0.03	
06/03/14	review PGE discovery responses relevant to Hamilton/Blakeslee	0.3	0.5	0.1	
06/03/14	email to Geesman re: Hamilton + Diablo Cove fault	0.04	0.04		
06/03/14	email from Geesman re: Hamilton Testimony plans	0.08	0.08		
06/04/14	review Scoping Memo from Commissioner Florio	0.04	0.04	0.03	
06/07/14	review initial draft of Hamilton Testimony Outline	0.5	0.5	0.2	0.2
06/08/14	TRAVEL from SLO to Dr. Hamilton in Atherton, CA				3.5
06/09/14	draft, review + edit Dr. Hamilton Testimony	4	3		
06/10/14	review + format Dr. Hamilton Testimony	4	3		
06/10/14	TRAVEL from Dr. Hamilton in Atherton to SLO				3.5

06/13/14	finalize, format and transmit first draft Hamilton Testimony to Geesman	1.3	1			
06/13/14	research and download data for Sewell/NRC tsuanmi study	0.3	0.45			
06/16/14	email w/Gessman re: Hamilton Testimony	0.02				
06/16/14	revise + Edit Hamilton Testimony; prepare graphics + map displays	4	4			
06/17/14	revise + Edit Hamilton Testimony; prepare graphics + map displays	3				
06/18/14	revise + Edit Hamilton Testimony; prepare graphics + map displays	3	2			
06/19/14	revise + Edit Hamilton Testimony; prepare graphics + map displays	1	1			
06/20/14	prepare PDF/A format for Hamilton Testimony; transmit to Geesman	0.02	0.02			
06/23/14	email w/Geesman re: Sewell + tsunmai hazard + final seismic report	0.01	0.01			
06/24/14	email w/Geesman re: Sewell + tsunmai hazard + final seismic report	0.02	0.03			
06/25/14	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee letter	0.01	0.01			
07/09/14	review PG&E data requests from Geesman	0.2	0.2			
07/10/14	prepare data request answers from Hamilton; transcribe + to Geesman	0.3	0.6			
07/24/14	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee meetings vs. letter	0.01	0.01	0.01		
07/25/16	email w/Geesman re: PG&E rebuttal testimony, NAS report	0.02	0.02	0.02		
07/26/14	email w/Geesman re: discovery strategy on rebuttal	0.04	0.04	0.04		
07/27/14	conference call w/Hamilton re: ERRA chapter 5	0.25				
07/28/14	review PG&E ERRA filing Chapter 5; condense + review for Hamilton	1	1			
07/30/14	transcribe geophysical union paper summary for Hamilton		0.4			
08/15/14	emails w/Geesman on review of 5 discovery requests from PGE	0.08	0.08	0.08		
08/20/14	review Gunderson Report on Shoreline Fault; mail to Hamilton	0.3	0.4			
08/22/14	review Gunderson Report on Shoreline Fault; mail to Hamilton	0.3	0.3	0.3		
08/22/14	review relevant PG&E discovery responses re: Hamilton Testimony	0.4	0.4			
08/23/14	conference call w/Hamilton - review his latest "study" + Hardebeck USGS		0.33			
08/25/14	update call with John Geesman re: hearings	0.25	0.25	0.25		
08/26/14	Review FOE petition, Peck DPO, and NRC FOIA materials		0.8			
08/28/14	read/analyze Hardebeck referenced emails in ERRA		0.5			
08/28/14	conference call w/Hamilton on cross examination		0.25			
08/28/14	read/analyze Hardebeck referenced emails in ERRA data request	0.25	0.25			
08/29/14	email PGE files to Hardebeck USGS.; email to Bruce Gibson	0.02	0.02			
09/02/14	conference call w/Hamilton re: his need for graphics from SSHAC + USGS		0.5			
09/02/14	compile and extract PDFs from USGS + SSHAC--email to Hamilton		0.5			
09/03/14	email canceling ERRA cross; confirm w/Hamilton + Geesman				0.25	
09/03/14	conference call Hamilton re: needs for Reply brief--answers PGE rebuttal		0.5			
09/05/14	research early PG&E video explanation of LTSP program + Lloyd Cluff		0.5			
09/08/14	analyze transcript from ERRA proceeding; email comment to Geesman	0.3	0.3			
09/09/14	respond by email to pre-notification of final seismic report		0.1			
09/09/14	email w/Geesman re: final seismic report and role of Hamilton	0.25	0.25			
09/10/14	emails w/Geesman + Hamilton re: IPRP; NRC + Diablo Cove	0.25	0.25			

09/10/14	phone conference w/Blakeslee on PG&E seismic report findings	0.2	0.8			
09/10/14	conference call to Hamilton re: downloading seismic report	0.1	0.1			
09/11/14	email w/Geesman re: upcoming meetings with state agencies	0.1	0.1			
09/11/14	email responses w/Dr. Mark Legg re: Final Seismic Report		0.25			
09/11/14	download and print file Final Seismic Report (full documents)				0.5	
09/15/14	phone conference Geesman re: response to Lochbaum + UCS comment		0.33			
09/15/14	emails Sam Blakeslee + Dave Lochbaum UCS, need to set meeting	0.1	0.15			
09/16/14	phone conference Blakeslee re: Supervisor Gibson Op-Ed and report	0.1	0.25			
09/16/14	phone conference Geesman re: Blakesle, editorial + NRC/Peck rebuttal	0.1	0.4			
09/18/14	email w/Blakeslee re: IRPR and final AB1632 seismic report release		0.05			
09/19/14	phone conference w/Hamilton re: status of report Ch. 12 evaluation		0.5			
09/19/14	phone conference w/Becker: update-- Brian Cherry/CPUC emails to use				0.5	
09/22/14	review chapter INTRO of Final Seismic Review		0.33			
09/23/14	phone callw/Hamilton re: Final Seismic Review of Hamilton thesis		0.5			
09/23/14	review + analyze draft opening brief; reply w/ comments to Geesman	0.5	0.5	0.25		
09/24/14	email w/Geesman re: briefing schedules, IPRP meeting schedule	0.1	0.2			
09/30/14	meeting in San Francisco w/ California Coastal Commission staff	0.33	0.34	0.33		
09/30/14	meeting in San Francisco w/CEC staff	0.34	0.33	0.33		
10/01/14	meeting in San Francisco w/ CPUC Energy Division staff	0.2	0.19	0.19		
10/02/14	meet with Blakeslee re: analysis of PGE seismic report, Shoreline fault	0.1	0.65			
10/02/14	read and review draft Blakeslee report on PG&E Final Seismic Report	0.5	1.2	0.1		
10/03/14	review ORA Opening Brief	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.06	
10/12/14	review Geesman near final reply brief	0.3	0.4	0.3		
10/17/14	read PG&E + ORA rebuttal briefs, note comments to Geesman	.5	0.6	0.3		
10/13/14	read Hamilton Chapter 12 from Final Seismic report+ review to Geesman	0.7	1.2	0.1		
10/16/14	phone conference w/Blakeslee. re: DCISC and IPRP	0.25				
10/16/14	phone conference w/Hamilton re: PG&E reply download				0.1	
11/15/14	phone conference w/Hamilton re: rebuttal arguments to PGE for IPRP	0.75				
11/15/14	Phone call from Hamilton w/new information and rebuttal critique		0.25			
	<b>Totals David Weisman (2014)</b>	<b>43.24</b>	<b>46.61</b>	<b>14.35</b>	<b>17.01</b>	<b>121.21</b>
	<b>Travel Hours</b>				<b>15</b>	





**A.15-02-023 TIME RECORDS OF JOHN GEESMAN**

<u>DATE</u>	<u>ACTIVITY</u>	<u>EVASION OF IPRP</u>	<u>JOINT RUPTURE</u>	<u>CZMA ANALYSIS</u>	<u>GROUND MOTION</u>	<u>OTHER</u>	<u>TOTAL</u>
12/4/2015	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP Report #10, Bruce Gibson background w. Cluff	0.02		0.02			0.04
12/4/2015	read IPRP Report #10	0.12	0.12	0.12	0.11		0.47
12/3/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Bruce Gibson & Lloyd Cluff	0.04		0.03			0.07
11/13/2015	read email from Charles Middlekauff					0.02	0.02
11/12/2015	draft Notice of Written Ex Parte Communication					0.03	0.03
11/2/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton meeting			0.02			0.02
11/1/2015	draft seismic-related portion of comments on 2015 IEPR	0.58	0.59	0.59	0.59		2.35
10/26/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Reply Brief, PG&E Opening Brief, PG&E Reply Brief	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		0.08
10/25/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Governor's comment on PG&E seismic work	0.01	0.01	0.01			0.03
10/23/2015	review PG&E Reply Brief	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.08		0.33
10/23/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Reply Brief	0.01			0.01		0.02
10/22/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Reply Brief	0.01			0.01		0.02
10/22/2015	draft Reply Brief	0.44	0.44	0.44	0.45		1.77
10/19/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Reply Brief	0.01			0.01		0.02
10/19/2015	draft Reply Brief	0.33	0.33	0.33	0.33		1.32
10/18/2015	draft Reply Brief	1.22	1.22	1.22	1.22		4.88
10/17/2015	draft Reply Brief	1.02	1.02	1.02	1.02		4.08
10/16/2015	draft Reply Brief	0.7	0.7	0.7	0.7		2.8
10/16/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Case Weaver	0.02					0.02
10/16/2015	read email from Charles Middlekauff					0.02	0.02
10/16/2015	read email from ALJ Roscow					0.02	0.02
10/13/2015	read email from ALJ Roscow					0.02	0.02
10/13/2015	review email from Charles Middlekauff w. attachments					0.05	0.05
10/12/2015	read email from Charles Middlekauff					0.02	0.02
10/10/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Opening Brief	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.04
10/9/2015	review PG&E Opening Brief	0.17	0.17	0.16	0.17		0.67
10/9/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Opening Brief, coverup theme	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03		0.1
10/8/2015	draft Opening Brief	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		1.2
10/7/2015	read email from ALJ Roscow					0.04	0.04
10/7/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Opening Brief	0.01	0.01		0.01		0.03

10/7/2015 read email from Charles Middlekauff					0.05	0.05
10/6/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Opening Brief	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.04
10/6/2015 draft Opening Brief	0.97	0.97	0.97	0.97		3.88
10/6/2015 read transcript of Oct. 6 hearing	0.21	0.21	0.2	0.21		0.83
10/5/2015 draft Opening Brief	0.97	0.96	0.96	0.96		3.85
10/4/2015 draft Opening Brief	1.35	1.34	1.34	1.34		5.37
10/3/2015 draft Opening Brief	1.71	1.71	1.71	1.71		6.84
10/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: ramification of CCC staff report on SONGS ISFSI on DCNPP			0.02			0.02
10/2/2015 draft Opening Brief	1.98	1.98	1.97	1.98		7.91
10/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: ramification of CCC staff report on SONGS ISFSI on DCNPP			0.02			0.02
10/1/2015 review transcript of October 1 hearing	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.08		0.33
10/1/2015 draft Opening Brief	1.88	1.88	1.87	1.87		7.5
10/1/2015 correspondence w. clients re: NRC RAI				0.02		0.02
10/1/2015 review NRC RAI for site response data at DCNPP				0.19		0.19
9/30/2015 read email from ALJ Roscow					0.04	0.04
9/30/2015 read email and attachments from Charles Middlekauff					0.12	0.12
9/29/2015 draft Motion for Admission of Erratum w. new Blakeslee declaration		0.23	0.23	0.24		0.7
9/29/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee testimony		0.01	0.02	0.02		0.05
9/27/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP concerns w. GMPE's not reviewed through SSHAC	0.05			0.05		0.1
9/22/2015 correspondence w. clients re: FOE FOIA materials from NRC concerning CCCSIP, CEC non-attendance at IPRP	0.07	0.07	0.07	0.07		0.28
9/21/2015 draft Motion for Admission of Evidence w. assembled attachments	0.31	0.31	0.3	0.31		1.23
9/18/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee declaration, IPRP extension, ERRA timeline, PG&E coverup of deterministic results	0.11	0.11	0.1	0.11		0.43
9/17/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP video	0.01	0.01		0.01		0.03
9/16/2015 review PG&E Notice of Communication					0.1	0.1
9/16/2015 review PG&E motions to submit evidence and seal record					0.08	0.08
9/16/2015 read ALJ Roscow email					0.04	0.04
9/16/2015 read Charles Middlekauff email					0.04	0.04
9/15/2015 review video of IPRP meeting regarding magnitude saturation, joint rupture analysis	0.09	0.1		0.09		0.28
9/14/2015 correspondence w. clients re: major deficiencies in PG&E						

seismic work identified in A4NR testimony		0.03	0.04	0.03		0.1
9/14/2015 read ALJ Roscow email					0.02	0.02
9/14/2015 read Chris Clay email					0.02	0.02
9/11/2015 read ALJ Roscow email					0.04	0.04
9/11/2015 read Charles Middlekauff email					0.05	0.05
9/10/2015 read ALJ Roscow email					0.02	0.02
9/10/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: exhibits					0.2	0.2
9/10/2015 read Charles Middlekauff email					0.03	0.03
9/10/2015 review PG&E/ORA settlement language related to DCNPP					0.07	0.07
9/10/2015 correspondence w. clients re: CEC and IPRP	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.04
9/9/2015 correspondence w. CEC re: non-attendance at IPRP		0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
9/9/2015 debrief w. clients re: IPRP meeting	0.15	0.14	0.14	0.15		0.58
9/9/2015 attend and participate in IPRP meeting	0.63	0.62	0.62	0.63		2.5
9/9/2015 meet w. clients, Doug Hamilton re: IPRP issues	0.32	0.31	0.31	0.31		1.25
9/9/2015 correspondence w. clients re: peer review of PG&E 3-D Velocity Model report, NRC auditors and IPRP	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.04
9/9/2015 review NRC audit plan for PG&E SSHAC submittal	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.1		0.37
9/9/2015 read peer review of PG&E 3-D Velocity Model report				0.5		0.5
9/9/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: language of settlement w. ORA					0.02	0.02
9/8/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: language of settlement w. ORA					0.05	0.05
9/8/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP meeting	0.01			0.01		0.02
9/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP meeting	0.04			0.03		0.07
9/4/2015 read email from Charles Middlekauff					0.03	0.03
9/4/2015 correspondence w. ALJ Roscow re: A4NR waiver of hearing, cross-examination of PG&E and ORA					0.05	0.05
9/4/2015 correspondence w. PG&E, ORA re: need for hearing, stipulation to admission of data response	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		0.12
9/4/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E summary of settlement conference, Conger methodology applied to Geosciences Dept.	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.02	0.02	0.07
9/4/2015 participate in telephonic settlement conference w. PG&E, ORA					0.67	0.67
9/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: joint rupture analyses, PG&E waiver of cross, magnitude saturation	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.05		0.22
9/3/2015 correspondence w. ORA re: data request		0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
9/3/2015 draft data request to ORA		0.07	0.07	0.06		0.2
9/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E surrebuttal testimony, Blakeslee		0.02	0.02	0.01		0.05
9/1/2015 read emails from PG&E attorneys Middlekauff & Huffman					0.04	0.04
9/1/2015 correspondence w. Dick Meehan re: IPRP #9 graphic				0.03		0.03

8/31/2015	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP and magnitude saturation, surrebuttal testimony, Blakeslee reaction to NRC RAI	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.07		0.27
8/31/2015	review Charles Middlekauff email re: cross-examination					0.02	0.02
8/30/2015	correspondence w. PG&E re: cross-examination estimates					0.05	0.05
8/30/2015	review docs for stipulated admission	0.13	0.13	0.13	0.13		0.52
8/29/2015	correspondence w. clients re: cross-examination, prehearing strategy	0.02	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.14
8/29/2015	correspondence w. MFP re: magnitude saturation and joint ruptures		0.05	0.05	0.05		0.15
8/29/2015	review NRC RAI for SSHAC submittal	0.05					0.05
8/28/2015	review correspondence between PG&E, ALJ Roscow and ALJ Wilson re: cross-examination, exhibits, change of date					0.09	0.09
8/28/2015	review Notice of IPRP meeting	0.02					0.02
8/28/2015	review Notice of Settlement Conference					0.02	0.02
8/27/2015	review PG&E emails to ALJ Roscow and ALJ Wilson re: schedule conflict					0.04	0.04
8/25/2015	correspondence w. clients re: videotaping IPRP meeting	0.03					0.03
8/25/2015	correspondence w. PG&E re: cross-examination estimates, hearing schedule	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
8/24/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Carlos Rios documents, prehearing strategy	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		0.12
8/20/2015	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E responses to Fierce Energy	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.05
8/20/2015	review PG&E correspondence w. ALJ Wilson re: schedule conflict					0.04	0.04
8/19/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Supplemental Testimony		0.01		0.01		0.02
8/19/2015	draft Supplemental Testimony		1.11		1.11		2.22
8/18/2015	correspondence w. clients re: safety letter, Lettis response, CEC meeting	0.11	0.11	0.11	0.11		0.44
8/18/2015	meeting w. clients re: safety letter	0.08	0.08	0.08	0.09		0.33
8/18/2015	meeting w. clients and CEC Executive Office	0.36	0.35	0.35	0.36		1.42
8/18/2015	draft safety comments re: IPRP	0.25	0.24	0.24	0.24		0.97
8/18/2015	review PG&E email re: exhibit list and cross-examination times	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
8/17/2015	draft Supplemental Testimony		2.49		2.48		4.97
8/17/2015	review NRC audit plan for PG&E SSHAC submittal	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.05		0.17
8/14/2015	correspondence w. Sam Blakeslee re: PG&E rebuttal testimony		0.05	0.05	0.05		0.15
8/14/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee exchanges, PG&E rebuttal testimony		0.03	0.02	0.02		0.07

8/14/2015 review PG&E rebuttal testimony		0.11	0.11	0.11		0.33
8/13/2015 research magnitude saturation, draft second inquiry to A4NR seismic expert panel		0.39	0.38	0.38		1.15
8/13/2015 draft magnitude saturation inquiry to A4NR seismic expert panel		0.23	0.22	0.22		0.67
8/12/2015 research earthquake magnitude saturation		1.11	1.11	1.11		3.33
8/12/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E data responses		0.02				0.02
8/12/2015 review PG&E round 5 data responses		0.08	0.08	0.07		0.23
8/11/2015 review ORA opposition to Motion to Strike					0.25	0.25
8/11/2015 correspondence w. clients re: mtg. w. CEC Executive Office	0.02					0.02
8/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E communication with Energy Division		0.07				0.07
8/6/2015 read email from ALJ Roscow					0.02	0.02
8/5/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: supplemental and surrebuttal testimony		0.02	0.02	0.03		0.07
8/4/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: supplemental testimony		0.03	0.03	0.03		0.09
8/4/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: additional data requests		0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
8/4/2015 draft additional data requests		0.31	0.31	0.32		0.94
8/4/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Norm Abrahamson				0.02		0.02
8/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E data responses, IPRP, DCISC, Meehan		0.03	0.03	0.04		0.1
8/3/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: data responses		0.01	0.01	0.02		0.04
8/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Dr. Gene Nelson					0.02	0.02
8/1/2015 review PG&E fourth round data responses	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1
7/31/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E data responses	0.02					0.02
7/31/2015 review PG&E fourth round data responses	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.04		0.14
7/30/2015 correspondence w. clients re: response to CPUC solicitation of safety comments, NRC-related emails from PG&E, lack of PG&E data response on joint ruptures		0.08	0.09	0.09	0.08	0.34
7/27/2015 review PG&E ASLB filing re: OSB problems			0.05			0.05
7/27/2015 review PG&E Motion to Strike ORA testimony					0.08	0.08
7/27/2015 correspondence w. clients re: irregular foundation conditions at DCNPP					0.1	0.1
7/23/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E response to data requests		0.01		0.01		0.02
7/22/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: responses to data requests	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.02		0.05
7/22/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: responses to data requests	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		0.08
7/22/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Abrahamson, Bolt, IPRP	0.01	0.02	0.02	0.02		0.07
7/15/2015 correspondence w. Diane Curran re: Contingency Release doc,						

OBS non-performance	0.03	0.02			0.05
7/15/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Geesman testimony and AG's appointee to DCISC	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
7/14/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Geesman testimony, Blakeslee testimony, IPRP	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.06	0.22
7/14/2015 review and edit Blakeslee testimony	0.26	0.26	0.26		0.78
7/13/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Geesman testimony, Blakeslee testimony	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.07
7/9/2015 correspondence w. clients re: potential Hamilton testimony, Geesman testimony	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.2
7/9/2015 review draft of potential Hamilton testimony	0.27	0.26			0.53
7/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: fourth round data requests, Blakeslee testimony, possible Picker-Weisenmiller letter	0.03	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.13
7/7/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: new data requests		0.01	0.01		0.02
7/7/2015 draft fourth round data requests	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	1
7/7/2015 draft Geesman testimony	1.03	1.03	1.03	1.03	4.12
7/7/2015 review and edit draft Blakeslee testimony		0.32	0.31	0.31	0.94
7/6/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee testimony		0.02	0.01	0.01	0.04
7/6/2015 draft Geesman testimony	1.27	1.27	1.27	1.27	5.08
7/5/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Sean Burney, Kendra Ulrich request, new USGS mapping of offshore faults	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.11
7/5/2015 correspondence w. clients re: "new" USGS mapping of offshore faults	0.01	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.05
7/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton hypothesis and Northeast Vergent model	0.08	0.09	0.09		0.26
7/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: prerequisites for any Hamilton testimony, PG&E redaction agreement	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.12
7/2/2015 email w. Diane Curran re: A4NR-0560			0.05		0.05
7/2/2015 correspondence w. PG&E confirming details of meet and confer agreement	0.01			0.01	0.02
7/1/2015 meet and confer w. PF&E	0.17	0.17	0.16	0.17	0.67
7/1/2015 prepare for meet and confer	0.13	0.13	0.12	0.12	0.5
7/1/2015 draft Geesman testimony	0.47	0.47	0.47	0.47	1.88
7/1/2015 correspondence w. clients re: CCC staff interest in A4NR-0560			0.05		0.05
6/30/2015 correspondence w. clients re: cross-examination of Kent Ferre, NRC RAI and PG&E's non-conformance w. SPID, PG&E's version of what Elmo Collins said	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.21
6/30/2015 correspondence w. CEC re: IPRP	0.05				0.05

6/29/2015 draft Geesman testimony	2.2	2.19	2.19	2.19		8.77
6/29/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee testimony, using Dick Meehan		0.09	0.09	0.08		0.26
6/28/2015 correspondence w. clients re: rough draft of Geesman testimony	0.01	0.01		0.01		0.03
6/28/2015 draft Geesman testimony	2.21	2.21	2.21	2.21		8.84
6/27/2015 draft Geesman testimony	1.99	1.99	1.98	1.99		7.95
6/26/2015 draft Geesman testimony	1.29	1.28	1.28	1.28		5.13
6/26/2015 read scoping memo					0.16	0.16
6/25/2015 draft Geesman testimony	2.05	2.04	2.04	2.04		8.17
6/25/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E's version of what Elmo Collins said, Picker letter on DCNPP	0.08	0.09	0.09	0.09		0.35
6/24/2015 draft Geesman testimony	1.37	1.37	1.36	1.36		5.46
6/24/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee testimony, meeting w. NRC Regional Administrator		0.03	0.02	0.02		0.07
6/23/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: meet and confer	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		0.2
6/23/2015 correspondence w. clients re: mtg. w. NRC Regional Administrator		0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
6/22/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: meet and confer	0.01	0.01	0.01			0.03
6/21/2015 review PG&E privilege log for problem docs	0.32	0.31	0.31	0.31		1.25
6/20/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E response to data requests, exchange w. Budnitz on earthquakes	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.03		0.13
6/20/2015 review/categorize PG&E data responses by issue	1.39	1.39	1.39	1.39		5.56
6/19/2015 correspondence w. Budnitz re: only 2 earthquakes in PG&E velocity model				0.05		0.05
6/18/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee response to Budnitz DCISC comment, additional Art Howell email, Hamilton and Blakeslee references in PG&E data responses	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.18		0.69
6/18/2015 correspondence w. Budnitz re: only 2 earthquakes in PG&E				0.1		0.1
6/18/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: hearing dates					0.02	0.02
6/17/2015 drive from SLO to Orinda after DCISC meeting	1	1	1	1		4 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
6/17/2015 attend and participate in DCISC meeting	0.79	0.79	0.79	0.79		3.16
6/16/2015 attend and participate in DCISC meeting	2.88	2.88	2.87	2.87		11.5
6/15/2015 meeting w. clients re: case strategy	0.38	0.38	0.37	0.37		1.5
6/15/2015 drive from Orinda to SLO for DCISC meeting	1	1	1	1		4 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
6/15/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Motion to Compel, DCISC mtg.	0.05	0.05	0.04	0.04		0.18
6/14/2015 review/categorize PG&E data responses by issue	0.47	0.47	0.47	0.47		1.88
6/13/2015 review/categorize PG&E data responses by issue	2.11	2.1	2.1	2.1		8.41



6/11/2015 phone call w. clients re: Elmo Collins contact	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
6/11/2015 email w. clients re: DCISC				0.02	0.02
6/10/2015 review PG&E privilege log entries for inadequate justifications	0.23	0.23	0.22	0.22	0.9
6/10/2015 correspondence w. clients re: categorization of PG&E data responses by issue, Jearl Strickland, Blair Jones and Ed Halpin	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
6/10/2015 review/categorize PG&E data responses by issue	2	1.99	1.99	1.99	7.97
6/9/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Becker declaration, Art Howell, Motion to Compel,	0.13	0.13	0.12	0.12	0.5
6/9/2015 phone call with clients re: Motion to Compel	0.21	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.81
6/9/2015 draft Motion to Compel	0.35	0.34	0.34	0.34	1.37
6/9/2015 review/categorize PG&E data responses by issue	1.13	1.13	1.13	1.13	4.52
6/9/2015 revise/edit Becker declaration	0.11	0.11	0.1	0.1	0.42
6/9/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: privilege log	0.01	0.01			0.02
6/9/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: Elmo Collins, privilege log	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.17
6/8/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	1.94	1.93	1.93	1.93	7.73
6/8/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Art Howell, PG&E's revised responses to A4NR Questions 20-22, CCCSIP claims of town hall mtgs., PG&E response on Elmo Collins questions	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.17
6/8/2015 draft NOI	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.16	0.67 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
6/7/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	2.17	2.17	2.17	2.16	8.67
6/6/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	2.27	2.27	2.27	2.27	9.08
6/5/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	1.93	1.92	1.92	1.92	7.69
6/5/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E discovery responses, NRC Region IV Administrator	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.07
6/4/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	2.12	2.12	2.12	2.12	8.48
6/4/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Chip Cameron, Becker, declaration, Elmo Collins	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.12
6/3/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	1.15	1.15	1.14	1.14	4.58
6/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Becker declaration, Art Howell, NRC end-of-cycle meeting in SLO,	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.68
6/3/2015 review draft Becker declaration	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.15
6/2/2015 roundtrip travel from Orinda to Los Angeles for meeting w. David Fleishacker, counsel to MFP in original DCNPP licensing litigation	1.5	1.5	1.5	1.5	6 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
6/2/2015 strategy meeting w. David Fleishacker	0.75	0.75	0.75	0.75	3
6/2/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	0.32	0.31	0.31	0.31	1.25
6/1/2015 review PG&E responses to data requests	2.03	2.02	2.02	2.02	8.09
6/1/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Valerie Winn response to IPRP,					

PG&E discovery responses	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.1
6/1/2015 correspondence w. David Fleishacker re: consultation	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.04
5/29/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Art Howell	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
5/28/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Art Howell	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.1
5/27/2015 correspondence w. clients re: NRC summary of PG&E seismic mtg., Becker declaration, NRC audit of PG&E regulatory commitments, DCISC implied endorsement of Sewell, Motion to Compel strategy, third round discovery requests,	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.07	0.29
5/27/2015 review NRC summary of 4/28 public mtg. w. PG&E on SSHAC reports	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.1
5/26/2015 correspondence w. clients re: third round data requests	0.02				0.02
5/26/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: data requests	0.02				0.02
5/26/2015 draft third round data requests	0.22	0.22	0.22	0.21	0.87
5/26/2015 meet and confer w. PF&E	0.11	0.11	0.1	0.1	0.42
5/25/2015 correspondence w. clients re: draft IAEA report on seismic preparedness at Fukushima	0.01	0.01		0.01	0.03
5/23/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee testimony, PG&E internal self-policing	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.15
5/22/2015 correspondence w. clients re: NRC decision on FOE seismic petition, USGS mapping of seafloor near DCNPP,	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.2
5/22/2015 correspondence w. CEC re: PG&E notice of inappropriate contact w. Florio regarding ALJ Roscow	0.02				0.02
5/21/2015 correspondence w. clients re: request to Blakeslee for testimony, NRC seismic decision	0.08	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.3
5/21/2015 review NRC decision creating ASLB to hear DCNPP seismic concerns	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	1
5/20/2015 meeting w. clients re: case strategy	0.42	0.42	0.42	0.41	1.67
5/19/2015 correspondence w. Dick Meehan re: docs	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.07
5/19/2015 correspondence w. clients re: OBS, PG&E call, PG&E earthquake drill video, Dick Meehan, NEI award	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.37
5/19/2015 review SSHAC video of OBS presentation	0.13	0.13	0.13	0.13	0.52
5/19/2015 meet and confer phone call w. PG&E	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
5/19/2015 review PHC transcript, other materials, in preparation for meet and confer call	0.12	0.12	0.12	0.12	0.48
5/18/2015 correspondence w. clients re: NEI award for PG&E's seismic communications	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
5/15/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Art Howell and NSOC	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
5/15/2015 correspondence w. Dick Meehan re: documents on SSHAC	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.14

5/14/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Nuclear Safety Operating Committee, PHC transcript error	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.04
5/14/2015 read PG&E email re: Nuclear Safety Operating Committee	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
5/14/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: meet and confer	0.01	0.01			0.02
5/11/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Becker letter, PHC transcript for Art Howell	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.1
5/11/2015 draft Becker letter responding to PG&E 4/28/15 presentation claims regarding IPRP Reports #6, #8, and #9	0.46	0.46	0.46	0.45	1.83
5/11/2015 review video of NRC 4/28/15 public meeting on PG&E SSHAC submittal	0.15	0.15	0.14	0.14	0.58
5/10/2015 review video of NRC 4/28/15 public meeting on PG&E SSHAC submittal	0.75	0.75	0.75	0.75	3
5/8/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IEPR workshop followup letter	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.04
5/8/2015 attend and participate in PHC	0.34	0.33	0.33	0.33	1.33
5/8/2015 preparation for PHC	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.08	0.35
5/8/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: response to A4NR data request #22	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
5/8/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: schedule and data request #22	0.01			0.01	0.02
5/8/2015 review ORA email on schedule				0.02	0.02
5/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: followup letter to IEPR docket, PHC strategy on data request #22, OBS problems, PG&E non-production of documents	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.36
5/7/2015 draft Becker letter on missing San Simeon analysis and cost of AB 1632 studies as followup to IEPR workshop	0.4	0.4	0.4	0.4	1.6
5/7/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: document production	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.14
5/6/2015 correspondence w. clients re: DCISC meeting to approve contract w. Sewell	0.02		0.01		0.03
5/4/2015 review revised PG&E testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
5/1/2015 listen to voicemail from PG&E	0.01		0.01		0.02
4/30/2015 correspondence w. clients re: David Weisman dissection of NRC briefing on SSHAC report	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
4/29/2015 correspondence w. clients re: retrieval of malfunctioning OBS systems, NRC briefing on PG&E seismic studies,	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
4/29/2015 review NRC letter re: CZMA impact on processing DCNPP relicensing			0.05		0.05
4/28/2015 meeting w. David Lochbaum, Ed Randolph, and clients	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.16	0.67
4/27/2015 attend CEC IEPR workshop on DCNPP seismic studies	0.78	0.78	0.78	0.78	3.12
4/27/2015 meeting w. David Lochbaum, John Laird, and clients	0.11	0.1	0.1	0.11	0.42
4/27/2015 correspondence w. CEC re: IPRP	0.02				0.02

4/26/2015	correspondence w. clients re: IEPR workshop	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.07
4/24/2015	correspondence w. PG&E re: NDA vs. redaction	0.01	0.01			0.02
4/23/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee critique, Wills presentation, PHC, extension of IPRP, ALJ Barnett	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.24
4/23/2015	review Blakeslee critique		0.09	0.08	0.08	0.25
4/23/2015	review Wills' slides about IPRP	0.07	0.07	0.07	0.07	0.28
4/23/2015	read ALJ Notice of PHC					0.02
4/22/2015	correspondence w. CEC re: Valerie Winn response to IPRP	0.08				0.08
4/22/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Valerie Winn response to IPRP, PHC scheduling	0.27				0.02
4/22/2015	correspondence w. PG&E re: meet and confer call	0.01	0.01			0.02
4/22/2015	meet and confer call w. PG&E	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.2
4/20/2015	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E respinse on meet and confer issues, Gutenberg-Richter, A4NR data request #22, IPRP members and CPUC staff	0.05	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.18
4/20/2015	correspondence w. PG&E re: meet and confer issues	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.13
4/19/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Dave Jackson declaration		0.02	0.01		0.03
4/18/2015	draft Becker presentation for IEPR workshop on DCNPP	1.08	1.07	1.07	1.08	4.3
4/18/2015	correspondence w. Diane Curran re: Dave Jackson recommendation on ground motion expert				0.07	0.07
4/18/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Dave Jackson declaration, PG&E Site Response Report, August 2014 operability assessment	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.17
4/18/2015	review Dave Jackson declaration re: Wells-Coppersmith	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.1	0.38
4/18/2015	review PG&E Site Response Report	0.17	0.17	0.16	0.17	0.67
4/17/2015	review PG&E data responses	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.36
4/16/2015	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP expiration	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
4/15/2015	correspondence w. clients re: sending Michal's explanation to OIG, timeline discrepancy in NRC receipt of AB 1632 studies, NRC webcast on DCNPP seismic re-evaluation, talking point for Governor's meeting	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.22
4/15/2015	review NRC notice of webcast of PG&E briefing on seismic studies		0.01	0.01	0.01	0.03
4/15/2015	draft talking points on DCNPP seismic issues for clients	0.8	0.79	0.79	0.8	3.18
4/14/2015	correspondence w. ALJ Roscow and parties re: PHC					0.05
4/13/2015	correspondence w. clients re: talking points for meeting with Governor, PG&E Response to Protest	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.04
4/13/2015	review PG&E Response to Protest	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05	0.18
4/12/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Florio statement on DCNPP			0.02		0.02

4/12/2015 review CPUC mtg. webcast for Florio statement on DCNPP	0.07	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.25
4/11/2015 phone call w. clients re: strategy after Picker statement	0.15	0.14	0.14	0.15	0.58
4/11/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Meltdown Malibu, Picker statement	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.04
4/10/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Picker statement, PG&E initial data responses, PG&E response to Data Request #8 (Sewell), John Laird	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.1	0.38
4/10/2015 review Picker statement on PG&E safety culture	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05	0.18
4/10/2015 review PG&E initial data responses	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05	0.18
4/10/2015 correspondence w. David Fleishacker re: consultation	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
4/9/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E fine	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
4/8/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Protest	0.01	0.01			0.02
4/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Lockbaum meetings	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
4/7/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: their summary of conference call	0.01	0.01		0.01	0.03
4/7/2015 correspondence w. Patricia Chinn-Gambale re: timeliness of Protest filing					0.2
4/6/2015 correspondence w. Dorah Shuey re: Hosgri LOCA analysis for LAR					0.17
4/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Protest	0.01	0.01		0.01	0.03
4/3/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: timing of responses to data requests	0.07	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.25
4/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Protest	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.07
4/1/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Mecham inquiry to Barry Allen, PG&E compliance infractions	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	0.1
3/31/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Mecham inquiry to Barry Allen, relicensing, operability assessment on CCCSIP, draft Protest	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.08	0.3
3/31/2015 edit and revise Protest	0.19	0.19	0.18	0.19	0.75
3/30/2015 correspondence w. clients re: missing CZMA conformity info, Protest, Macfarlane correspondence, Art Howell, OIG meeting,	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.37
3/30/2015 correspondence w. Dorah Shuey re: Hosgri LOCA analyses					0.05
3/30/2015 draft Protest	1.58	1.58	1.57	1.58	6.31
3/29/2015 draft Protest	0.62	0.62	0.61	0.62	2.47
3/28/2015 draft Protest	1.79	1.78	1.78	1.79	7.14
3/27/2015 correspondence w. clients re: potential Hamilton testimony, Dr. Gene Nelson and Dan Hirsch	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.07	0.27
3/27/2015 draft Protest	1.26	1.25	1.25	1.26	5.02
3/26/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Lochbaum on PG&E lying about LVBP, Picker statement at Hueso hearing	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.13
3/25/2015 draft Protest	1.35	1.34	1.34	1.35	5.38

3/25/2015	correspondence w. clients re: ex parte rules					0.03	0.03
3/24/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Peck's response to SSHAC, SSHAC video and Baran,	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.04		0.15
3/24/2015	review and annotate IPRP Reports #7, #8, #9	0.61	0.6	0.6	0.61		2.42
3/23/2015	correspondence w. clients re: SSHAC video for Supes mtg., data requests, OIG mtg., Art Howell emails, Elmo Collins	0.11	0.1	0.1	0.11		0.42
3/22/2015	correspondence w. clients re: initial data requests, PHC, potential Blakeslee testimony, O'Keefe call, AP 1000 design and CA seismic standards	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09		0.36
3/22/2015	draft initial round of data requests	0.55	0.54	0.54	0.54		2.17
3/21/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Bruce Gibson response to SSHAC release, SSHAC video	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02		0.07
3/20/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Supes mtg. amd SSHAC video	0.01	0.01				0.02
3/19/2015	correspondence w. clients re: redacted exhibit					0.02	0.02
3/18/2015	correspondence w. clients re: tsunami analysis, Supes mtg. and SSHAC video, ALJ Barnett and ERRA Protest, PD on FOE petition and ramification for ERRA Protest	0.09	0.09	0.08	0.09		0.35
3/18/2015	review PG&E Notice of Communication w. Energy Division	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.16
3/18/2015	review PG&E SAMA document associated w. CCSIP	0.88	0.88	0.88	0.88		3.52
3/18/2015	draft Notice of Ex Parte Communication	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.09		0.37
3/17/2015	correspondence w. FOE re: Hosgri LOCA, LBVP, Halpin GRC testimony		0.15	0.14			0.29
3/17/2015	review NRC reaction to CCCSIP report, past guidance on ground motion analysis	1.01	1	1	1.01		4.02
3/17/2015	research Hosgri LOCA analysis and LBVP	0.38	0.37	0.37	0.38		1.5
3/16/2015	correspondence w. clients re: reaction to FOE/Hirsch assessment of seismic coverup		0.14	0.13			0.27
3/15/2015	review EPRI SPID document	1	1	1	1		4
3/15/2015	review PG&E SSC SSHAC Report	1.28	1.28	1.27			3.83
3/14/2015	review SWUS GMC Report					8.72	8.72
3/14/2015	correspondence w. clients re: induced seismicity white papers			0.01	0.02		0.03
3/14/2015	review induced seismicity white papers for limitations on GMPEs in near field, instrumentation for site characterization	0.47			0.48		0.95
3/13/2015	correspondence w. clients re: OIG investigation, SSHAC response, ASLB transcript,	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.06		0.22
3/13/2015	review PG&E SPID Report	1.04	1.03	1.03	1.04		4.14
3/12/2015	correspondence w. clients re: SSHAC response, PG&E GMPE promiscuity = intentional deception, ASLB timing, SSHAC video,						

PG&E telephonic update to NRC on relicensing, ASLB transcript	0.12	0.12	0.12	0.12	0.48
3/12/2015 review transcript of ASLB hearing on FOE petition for PG&E seismic representation s	0.3	0.29	0.29	0.29	1.17
3/12/2015 review DCNPP chapters from PG&E testimony	0.15	0.14	0.14	0.15	0.58
3/11/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Gamson comment on PG&E ex parte ban				0.03	0.03
3/10/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E testimony, proceeding schedule, Norm Abrahamson video	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.08
3/9/2015 correspondence w. clients re: response to PG&E's SSHAC claims, redaction, Peck's take on Hirsch hypothesis	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.09	0.34
3/8/2015 correspondence w. clients re:Hirsch hypothesis, Eric Greene	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	0.1
3/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton/Weisman visit to DCNPP site, Hirsch hypothesis, insect attention span	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.04	0.15
3/6/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP Report #9	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
3/6/2015 review IPRP Report #9	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.08	0.33
3/5/2015 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP report, David Baker, OIG investigation	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	0.1
3/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: OIG investigation	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05	0.18
3/2/2015 phone call w. clients re: OIG investigation	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.16
3/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: OIG investigation, Norm Abrahamson video	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.07
2/25/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E non-attendance at Peevey retirement gala				0.02	0.02
2/24/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Picker interview, Sewell report	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.06	0.22
2/23/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Court of Appeal, Carol Brown, Peevey investigators				0.06	0.06
2/22/2015 correspondence w. clients re: DCISC and NRC redacted communications plan	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.07
2/21/2015 correspondence w. Wasserman re: seismic critique of DCNPP	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
2/20/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Hirsch critique of IPRP	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05	0.18
2/18/2015 correspondence w. clients re: redaction				0.02	0.02
2/17/2015 correspondence w. clients re: redaction, Blakeslee disgust over seismic studies	0.01	0.01		0.13	0.15
2/16/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Senator Hill's prediction of indictment/prison for Peevey				0.1	0.1
2/15/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Hodin's take on Abrahamson	0.01	0.01			0.02
2/13/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Peevey, Abrahamson	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.04	0.15
2/12/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Hodin's take on Abrahamson,					

IEPR scope, Peevey	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.24
2/11/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Peevey, NRC communications plan for DCNPP	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.09
2/10/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E emails	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
2/9/2015 draft Notices of Ex Parte Communication	0.07	0.07	0.07	0.07	0.28
2/9/2015 research PG&E emails	0.65	0.65	0.64	0.65	2.59
2/8/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E emails, Peevey event	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
2/8/2015 research PG&E emails	1.18	1.18	1.18	1.18	4.72
2/7/2015 correspondence w. clients re: DCNPP economics, DCISC	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	0.1
2/6/2015 review PG&E response to FOE NRC petition		0.86	0.86	0.86	2.58
2/6/2015 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E comments on IEPR scope, NRDC comments on IEPR scope, DCISC video clips	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.04	0.14
2/6/2015 review selected video clips of DCISC meeting	0.17	0.16	0.16	0.16	0.65
2/5/2015 review PG&E materials responding to FOE 2nd Circuit case	0.36	0.35	0.35	0.36	1.42
2/5/2015 correspondence w. Hayden re: DCISC seismic library	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	0.1
2/5/2015 correspondence w. clients re: ex parte communication, Kammerer	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.06	0.22
2/4/2015 correspondence w. clients re: DCISC meeting	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
2/4/2015 drive roundtrip from Orinda to SLO for DCISC meeting	2	2	2	2	8 <a href="#">***@50% hourly rate</a>
2/4/2015 attend and participate in DCISC meeting	1.13	1.12	1.12	1.13	4.5
2/4/2015 phone call w. Hayden re: DCNPP seismic issues	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.4
2/4/2014 strategy meeting w. clients	0.38	0.37	0.37	0.38	1.5
2/3/2015 correspondence w. clients re: tornado chart from DCISC mtg., CPUC emails, Wills response to Becker letter	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.36
2/3/2015 phone call w. clients re: Chris Wills response to Becker letter	0.11	0.1	0.11	0.1	0.42
2/3/2015 review Chris Wills response to Becker letter to Picker and Weisenmiller	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.08	0.33
2/2/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Peevey-Cherry emails on relicensing, CPUC emails, Eric Greene, Lindh-Cherry emails on Florio, Peevey-Cherry emails	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.07	0.27
2/2/2015 correspondence w. PG&E re: schedule				0.02	0.02
2/2/2015 phone call w. PG&E re: schedule				0.08	0.08
2/1/2015 correspondence w. clients re: DCNPP seismic comments on IEPR scoping order	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.05
2/1/2015 draft DCNPP seismic comments on 2015 IEPR scoping order	0.75	0.75	0.75	0.75	3
2/1/2015 correspondence w. Hayden re: DCNPP	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	0.1
1/31/2015 correspondence w. clients re: Peevey-Cherry emails on DCNPP relicensing, PG&E-CPUC emails	0.11	0.11	0.1	0.11	0.43



1/30/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Anne Kammerer	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03		0.1
1/29/2015	correspondence w. Sherry Lewis re: IPRP and Abrahamson	0.01	0.01				0.02
1/27/2015	correspondence w. clients re: injecting DCNPP seismic issues into 2015 IEPR	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03		0.1
1/22/2015	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E email to ASLB, response to FOE lawsuit	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.16
1/15/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Picker inaugural statement	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		0.08
1/14/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Budnitz response to Picker/ Weisenmiller letter, Burns and DCNPP design basis change, IPRP meeting video, Picker-Weisenmiller letter	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.06		0.23
1/13/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Picker-Weisenmiller letter, Blakeslee seismic materials, reasonable seismic event	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.16
1/12/2015	correspondence w. clients re: IPRP video	0.01	0.01	0.01			0.03
1/11/2015	review NRC embrittlement document					0.1	0.1
1/11/2015	review Santa Lucia Chapter's writeup of DCNPP seismic issues	0.08	0.08	0.08	0.08		0.32
1/11/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Japanese comparison of \$846 million seismic retrofit requirement, Picker email deletion policy,	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		0.08
1/9/2015	correspondence w. clients re: video of IPRP meeting	0.01	0.01	0.01			0.03
1/8/2015	correspondence w. clients re: Norm Abrahamson tornado chart, IPRP meeting	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02		0.07
1/8/2015	attend and participate in IPRP meeting	0.61	0.6	0.6	0.61		2.42
1/8/2015	meet w. clients to discuss IPRP strategy	0.13	0.12	0.12	0.13		0.5
12/31/2014	correspondence w. clients re: DCNPP economic metrics, Picker interview and followup letter					0.15	0.15
12/25/2014	correspondence w. clients re: questions deriving from FOE FOIA materials, NRC staff still waiting for PG&E reports	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.05		0.21
12/25/2014	review FOE FOIA materials from NRC	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		1
12/24/2014	review IPRP Reports #7 and #8		1	1			2
12/23/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Uselding post on NRC website, Weisman writeup of NRC/CCCSIM timelines		0.11	0.11	0.11		0.33
12/22/2014	correspondence w. clients re: PG&E self-reporting additional inappropriate emails					0.1	0.1
12/19/2014	correspondence w. clients re: source of DCNPP 5th ranking on most embrittled list					0.05	0.05
12/17/2014	correspondence w. clients re: Peck DPO and CCCSIM timing, Peck retraction of comment on DCNPP inspection report	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03		0.1
12/16/2014	correspondence w. clients re: FOE FOIA materials, NRC						

inspection report discussion of CCCSIM	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.07
12/14/2014 correspondence w. clients re: NRC response to FOE lawsuit	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.03
12/12/2014 correspondence w. clients re: DCNPP and CZMA			0.03		0.03
12/11/2014 correspondence w. clients re: NRC letter on site response and IPRP				0.07	0.07
12/11/2014 review NRC letter on site response and data collection				0.23	0.23
12/11/2014 review NRC letter on development of seismic risk evaluations	0.08				0.08
12/10/2014 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E ASLB update letter	0.04	0.04	0.04		0.12
12/8/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee statement	0.01	0.01			0.02
12/6/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Peck		0.01	0.01		0.02
12/5/2014 correspondence w. CEC re: Blakeslee statement	0.03	0.02			0.05
12/5/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee statement, questions for Peck	0.04	0.03	0.03		0.1
12/5/2014 read Blakeslee 26-page statement	0.18	0.19	0.18		0.55
12/3/2014 watch live webcast of US Senate EPW hearing featuring Blakeslee and Hirsch	1.13	1.12	1.12	1.13	4.5
12/2/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee statement	0.05	0.05	0.05		0.15
11/26/2014 correspondence w. clients re: boundaries between SSHAC and AB 1632 studies	0.02				0.02
11/25/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Weiss critique on depth of earthquake, Hamilton written followup to IPRP presentation, IPRP and deterministic assessment,	0.09	0.08	0.08		0.25
11/17/2014 attend and participate in IPRP meeting	1.32	1.31	1.31	1.31	5.25
11/17/2014 meeting w. clients, Hamilton re: PG&E's IPRP presentations		0.5	0.5		0.1
11/16/2014 meeting w. clients, Hamilton to prep for IPRP meeting	1	1	1	1	4
11/15/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton prep for IPRP meeting, PG&E LAR for seismic qualification of fuel assemblies		0.01	0.01	0.25	0.27
11/14/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton prep for IPRP meeting,		0.03	0.02		0.05
11/11/2014 review Blakeslee seismic paper		0.48	0.48	0.48	1.44
11/11/2014 correspondence w. clients re: deterministic scorecard for CCCSIM		0.05	0.05		0.1
11/10/2014 correspondence w. clients re: PG&E seismic presentation to DCISC		0.03	0.02		0.05
11/9/2014 review DCISC meeting video	0.94	0.93	0.93	0.94	3.74
11/8/2014 review DCISC meeting video	1.4	1.39	1.39	1.4	5.58
11/7/2014 correspondence w. clients re: DCISC's tsunami FOIA request, CGS belief in trenching		0.07	0.07	0.06	0.2
11/6/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Hamilton prep for IPRP meeting		0.05	0.05		0.1

11/5/2014 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP meeting		0.04	0.04			0.08	
11/4/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Sewell report, IPRP meeting		0.04	0.03			0.07	
10/29/2014 correspondence w. clients re: FOE lawsuit over FSAR change		0.04	0.03			0.07	
10/28/2014 review FOE Court of Appeal filing		0.13	0.12			0.25	
10/26/2014 correspondence w. clients re: review of Hamilton presentation to IPRP		0.02	0.01			0.03	
10/25/2014 correspondence w. clients re: IPRP meeting	0.03					0.03	
10/23/2014 correspondence w. clients re: questions on CCCSIM report	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01		0.05	
10/18/2014 correspondence w. Blakeslee re: his critique of CCCSIM	0.01	0.01				0.02	
10/15/2014 correspondence w. clients re: Lloyd Cluff					0.02	0.02	
10/14/2014 correspondence w. clients re: CCCSIM and Hamilton		0.02	0.01			0.03	
	<b>Totals</b>	105.38	114.31	110.06	120.57	4.57	454.89

A.15-02-023 TIME RECORDS OF ROCHELLE BECKER						
Date	Task	IPRP	JT. RUPT.	CZMA	GRND MOT.	OTHER
10/14/2014	emails w atty/staff re:CCCSIP Hamilton	0.02	0.01			
11/4/2014	emails w atty/staff re: Sewell, IPRP meet			0.04	0.04	
11/14/2014	emails w atty/staff re: Hamilton prep		0.03	0.02		
12/3/2014	watch Senate EPW Hearing Boxer w/Blakeslee Hirsch	1.13	1.12	1.12		
12/4/2014	email atty/staff re: IPRP Gibson and Cluff	0.02				
12/4/2014	read IPRP Report #10	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	
12/5/2014	read Blakeslee statement (26 pages)	0.15	0.15	0.15		
12/10/2014	email with atty/staff re: PG&E ASLB update	0.04	0.04	0.04		
12/16/2014	emails w atty/staff re: FOE FOIA NRC inspect CCSIM	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	
12/22/2014	review and email art on PG&E self-reporting and inappropriate email				0.1	
12/25/2014	emails w atty/staff re FOE FOIA materials, NRC awaits PG&E rept	0.02	0.01	0.04	0.04	
1/7/2015	TRAVEL from SLO to SF for IPRP at CPUC					4
1/8/2015	meet with atty IPRP strategy	0.13	0.12	0.13	0.12	
1/8/2015	attend IPRP and participate in meeting at CPUC	0.61	0.6	0.6	0.61	
1/11/2015	email atty/staff re: Japan's seismicretrofit &Picker email delete policy	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
1/11/2015	email atty/staff Diablo embrittlement post review of NRC rept				0.05	
1/13/2015	email atty/staff re: CEC/CPUC ltr, Blakeslee seismic rept, seismic events	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04	
1/14/2015	email atty/staff re: DCISC response to CEC/CPUC ltr design basis	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
1/27/2015	email atty/staff re: injecting DCNPP seismic concerns into IEPR	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	
1/31/2015	email atty/staff re Peevey-Cherry email on relic, CPUC-PGE emails	0.11	0.11	0.1	0.11	
2/1/2014	email with atty/staff re: tsunami repts	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
2/2/2015	review and approve A4NR draft DCISC comments on IEPR scope	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	
2/2/2015	emails with atty/staff re:Peevey-Cherry DCNPP relic, CPUC emails	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.07	
2/2/2014	review Wills (Ca Geo Survey) response to A4NR letter	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
2/3/2015	phonw call w atty/staff re: Wills response to A4NR letter	0.11	0.1	0.11	0.1	
2/3/2015	email atty/staff re: Tornado chart from DCISC meeting	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09	
2/4/2015	strategy meeting with atty/staff	0.38	0.37	0.38	0.37	
2/4/2015	attend DCISC meeting focus: seismic issues	1.13	1.12	1.12	1.13	
2/5/2015	email atty/staff re: exparte Kammerer	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.06	
2/6/2015	email atty/staff re: PGE-NRDC comments on IEPR	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.04	
2/6/2015	email atty re: DCNPP nuclear economic & DCISC	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	
2/8/2015	email atty Peevey emails and event	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	
2/12/2015	emails atty/staff re: Hodin, EPRP, CEC	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.06	
2/20/2015	email atty/staff :Hirsch critique of IPRP	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05	
2/22/2015	email w atty/staff re: DCISC and redaction	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.01	
2/23/2015	email w/ atty/staff re: FOE court of appeal, Peevey, Brown investigation	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	

3/2/2015	phone call w atty/staff re: OIG investigation	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		
3/3/2015	email w atty/staff re: OIG investigation	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.05		
3/7/2014	email with NRC re: IPRP #9	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
3/7/2014	emails with atty/staff re: Hamilton/Weisman DCNPP tour	0.04	0.04	0.03	0.04		
3/9/2015	emails with atty/staff re: PGE SSHAC claims, NRC redact, Hirsh Peck	0.09	0.08	0.08	0.09		
3/11/2015	email with atty/staff re: exparte ban	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
3/12/2015	emails w atty/staff re: SSHAC resp, PGE GMPE, ASLB timing NRC relic	0.12	0.12	0.12	0.12		
3/16/2015	emails atty/staff re: FOE/Hirsch seismic assessment		0.14	0.13			
3/18/2015	email w atty/staff re: tsunami anal, sups meet, SSHAC, Barnett, ERRA, FOE	0.09	0.09	0.08	0.09		
3/21/2015	email atty/staff re: Gibson response to SSHAC video	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02		
3/22/2015	email w atty/staff re: data req, PHC, Blakeslee, Okeefe AP1000 CS seismic	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09		
3/23/2015	email atty/staff re: SSHAC video, data req, OIG, Howell emails E.Collins	0.11	0.1	0.1	0.11		
3/24/2015	email atty/staff Peck response to SSHAC, SSHAC video and Comm Baran	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
3/26/2017	emails w atty/staff re: Lochbaum (UCS) on PG&E/LVBP, Picker/Hueso hear	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.03		
3/30/2015	emails w atty/staff re: CZMA conformity	0.01	0.09	0.09	0.09		
4/1/2015	emails atty/staff re:Mecham, relic, PGE compliance infractions	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03		
4/3/2015	emails with A. Howell re: PG&E seismic (former NRC Reg 4 head	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		
4/8/2015	review and approve A4NR draft protest.	0.15	0.15	0.15	0.15		
4/9/2015	emails with atty re: PG&E fine	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01		
4/10/2015	emails w atty/staff re: Lochbaum appts w/ state re: seismic aging nukes	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.01		
4/10/2015	emails w atty/staff data responses (Sewell) Laird meet, Picker statement	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.1		
4/10/2015	emails w atty/staff re: Picker statement, Meltdown Malibu	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
4/10/2015	phone call with atty/staff re: strategy post Picker statement	0.15	0.14	0.14	0.15		
4/12/2015	emails w atty/staff re: Picker Florio comments in transcript			0.02			
4/13/2015	review PGE response to Protest	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
4/15/2015	emails atty/staff re EPW on Diablo seismic issues, NRC 1632, OIG	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.05		
4/19/2015	review Becker comments for IEPR workshop DCNPP issues	0.5	0.45	0.6	0.5		
4/22/2015	emais atty/staff re: PGE resp Meet&Confer, A4NR DR, IPRP and CPUC staff	0.27					
4/23/2015	emails on Wills Gibson IPRP concerns	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
4/27/2015	meeting with atty/staff Lochbaum Laird re: seismic issues at DC	0.11	0.11	0.1	0.1		
4/27/2015	present seismic concerns at CEC IEPR workshop	0.78	0.78	0.78	0.78		
4/28/2015	meetint with atty/staff Lochbaum Ed Randolph seismic issues	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.16		
4/28/2015	TRAVEL SFO to SAN from meeting with state regulators						4
4/29/2015	email with atty/staff re: OBS malfunction, NRC ltr re: CZMA on relic			0.05			
5/6/2015	emails w atty/staff re: DCISC meet to approve Sewell contract	0.02		0.01			
5/7/2015	review letter email with atty/staff re: San Simeon, PHC DR22, OBS	0.09	0.09	0.09	0.09		
5/7/2015	TRAVEL SLO to SF for PHC at CPUC						4
5/8/2015	email with atty/staff re: IEPR workshop follow up	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
5/8/2015	attend PHC & participate	0.34	0.33	0.33	0.33		

5/11/2015	emails w atty/staff Becker ltr to CEC, Howell information	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.02		
5/19/2015	email w atty/staff re OBS, PGE call, Meehan, NEI award	0.1	0.09	0.09	0.09		
5/21/2015	emails w atty/staff re Blakeslee req for testimony, NRC seismic dec.	0.08	0.08	0.07	0.07		
5/22/2015	email with atty/staff re NRC dec. on FOE seismic USGS map DC floor	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		
5/26/2015	email w atty/staff 3rd round data requests	0.02					
5/27/2015	email with atty/staff re NRC summary PGE seismic, Becker declaration...	0.08	0.07	0.07	0.07		
5/28/2015	email with atty re: Art Howell	0.03	0.03	0.02	0.02		
6/3/2015	email w atty/staff Becker declaration, Camerson/Howell emails, NRCEOC	0.17	0.17	0.17	17		
6/4/2015	email w atty re: Cameron, Becker Declaration, Howell input Elmo Collins	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		
6/5/2015	email w atty/staff data response, proposed meet with NRC Reg IV admin	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.01		
6/8/2015	Eemail w atty/staff re: data req, A. Howell, PG&E rev to A4NR DR, CCCSIP	0.05	0.04	0.04	0.04		
6/9/2015	phone call w atty/staff re: motion to compel	0.21	0.2	0.2	0.2		
6/9/2015	email w atty re: Becker declaration, Howell Motion to compel	0.13	0.13	0.12	0.12		
6/10/2015	email with atty/staff re: PG&E data resp by issue, Strickland, Jones, Halpin	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
6/11/2015	email w atty/staff re: DCISC				0.02		
6/16/2015	attend and participate in DCISC meet	0.38	0.38	0.37	0.37		
6/17/2015	attend and participate in DCISC meet	0.79	0.79	0.79	0.79		
6/18/2015	emal atty/staff re: Blakeslee resp to Budnitz, A. Howell email, Hamilton	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.18		
6/20/2015	email w atty/staff re: PG&E respon to DR, Budnitz on earthquakes	0.04	0.03	0.03	0.03		
6/22/2015	meet with Reg IV admin re: seismic issues and IPRP	0.3	0.3	0.3			
6/23/2015	email atty/staff recap and follow up on NRC Reg IV meet		0.01	0.01	0.01		
6/25/2015	email w atty/staff re: PG&E version Collins said, Picker ltr on DCNPP	0.08	0.09	0.09	0.09		
6/27/2015	read draft Geesman testimony	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3		
6/28/2015	email w atty/staff re: Geesman draft testimony	0.01		0.01	0.01		
6/30/2015	email w atty/staff re: Cross Ferre, NRC, PGE non-conformance/SPID Collins	0.06	0.05	0.05	0.05		
7/1/2015	email w atty/staff re: CCC staff interest in A4NR-0560				0.05		
7/5/2015	email w atty/staff re Burney, Ulrich req, new USGS map offshore fault	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		
7/7/2015	review 4th round A4NR data req to PG&E, Blakeslee test, poss CEC/CPUC ltr	0.03	0.04	0.03	0.04		
7/14/2015	read Blakeslees final testimony	0.4	0.3	0.4	0.4		
7/15/2015	email atty/staff re: Geesman testimony, IPRP	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02		
7/23/2015	email atty/staff PG&E responses to A4NR data requests	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.02		
7/30/2015	email atty/staff CPUC safety comments, NRC/PGE emails, Lack PGE D resp	0.08	0.09	0.09	0.08		
8/18/2015	meeting w atty/staff and CEC Executive office re: seismic issues IPRP	0.36	0.35	0.35	0.36		
8/18/2015	email atty re: CPUC safety letter	0.08	0.08	0.08	0.09		
8/20/2015	email atty re: PG&E respon to Fierce energy	0.01	0.01	0.01			
8/24/2015	email atty/staff Rios NRC OIG docs, prehearing strategy	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		
8/29/2015	email atty/staff cross exam/prehearing strategy	0.02	0.04	0.04	0.04		
8/31/2015	emal atty/staff re: IPRP, mag saturations, surrebuttall, Blakeslee NRC FAI	0.07	0.07	0.06	0.07		
9/3/2015	email atty/staff re: Joint rupt anal, PG&E waiver of cross, magnitude satur	0.06	0.06	0.05	0.05		

9/9/2015	attend IPRP meeting	0.63	0.62	0.62	0.63		
9/8/2015	email atty/staff re: IPRP meeting	0.01		0.01			
9/14/2015	email atty/staff re: deficiencies in PG&E seismic re: a4nr testimony		0.03	0.04	0.03		
9/22/2015	email atty/staff FOE info from NRC CCSIP, CEC non-attendance IPRP	0.07	0.07	0.7	0.07		
4/6/2016	Correspondence with atty/staff re: RCE impact on schedule for PD			0.02	0.02		
10/1/2015	email w atty/staff re: NRC RAI	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
10/6/2015	review and approve A4NR open brief	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
10/16/2015	email w atty/staff re: Casey Weaver CECC	0.02					
10/19/2015	email w atty/staff re: reply brief	0.01		0.01			
10/22/2015	review and approve A4NR Reply Brief	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
10/23/2015	email w atty re: reply brief	0.01		0.01			
10/26/2015	review PGE Reply Brief-seismic issues	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		
12/3/2015	email atty/staff re: Cluff/Gibson	0.04		0.03			
12/4/2015	read IPRP Report #10	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
12/4/2015	email atty/staff IPRP #10 Cluff/Gibson	0.02		0.02			
	<b>Totals ROCHELLE BECKER</b>	13.57	13	13.96	28.55	12	<b>81.08</b>
	<b>Travel Hours</b>					<b>12</b>	
		<b>2014 Hours</b>					
		1.5	1.48	1.52	0.3	0	<b>4.8</b>
		<b>2015 Hours</b>					
		12.07	11.52	12.44	28.25	12	<b>76.28</b>

A.15-02-023 TIME RECORDS OF DAVID WEISMAN						
Date	Task	EVADE IPRP	JT. RUPT.	CZMA	GRND MOT.	OTHER
10/14/14	email w/Geesman re: CCCSIP and Hamilton		0.02	0.01		
10/14/14	email w/Geesman re: Lloyd Cluff					0.02
10/14/14	Attend DCISC meeting in SLO - PGE Seismic presentation	2	2	2	2	
10/15/14	Attend DCISC meeting in SLO	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	
10/23/14	email w/Geesman re: questions on CCCSIM report	0.02	0.01	0.01	0.01	
10/26/14	email w/Geesman re: review of Hamilton presentation		0.02	0.01		
10/29/14	email w/Geesman re: FOE lawsuit over FSAR change		0.04	0.03		
11/04/14	email w/Geesman re: Sewell report, IPRP meeting		0.04	0.03		
11/05/14	email w/Geesman re: IPRP meeting		0.04	0.04		
11/06/14	email w/Geesman re: Hamilton prep for IPRP meeting		0.05	0.05		
11/07/14	email w/Geesman re: DCISC's tsunami FOIA request +CGS trenching idea		0.07	0.07	0.06	
11/10/14	email w/Geesman re: PG&E seismic presentation to DCISC		0.03	0.02		
11/14/14	email w/Geesman re: Hamilton prep for IPRP meeting		0.03	0.02		
11/15/14	email w/Geesman re: Hamilton prep for IPRP meeting; PGE LAR for fuel		0.01	0.01		0.25
11/14/14	conference call w/Hamilton re: plan for strategy session meeting		0.2	0.2		0.2
11/14/14	read Hamilton's draft IPRP report; download graphics + figures	0.3	0.5	0.75		
11/16/14	TRAVEL SLO to Atherton to meet w/Hamilton + Geesman					3.5
11/16/14	meeting w/Hamilton + Geesman re: IPRP presentation	1	1	1	1	
11/16/14	revise Hamilton graphics and create his Powerpoint for IPRP		0.5	0.5		
11/17/14	meeting w/Geesman + Hamilton re: PG&E's IPRP presentations		0.5	0.5		
11/17/14	attend and make videotape record of IPRP meeting @ CPUC in SF	1.32	1.31	1.31	1.31	
11/20/14	edit + upload IPRP meeting video record to Youtube for review					0.75
11/25/14	email w/Geesman re: Wyss seismic critique + Hamilton IPRP follow up	0.09	0.08	0.08		
11/26/14	email w/Geesman re: boundaries between SSHAC + AB 1632 study	0.02				
12/01/14	Blakeslee phone call re: EPW presentation; SSHAC + Munson PPT	0.1	0.1	0.15		
12/01/14	phone conference w/Gessman re: Blakeslee participation		0.67			
12/02/14	correspondence w. clients re: Blakeslee statement	0.05	0.05	0.05		
12/03/14	view webcast of US Senate EPW hearing featuring Blakeslee + Hirsch	1.13	1.12	1.12	1.13	
12/10/14	Detailed review of Blakeslee report--forward excerpt to Dr. DHH	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	
12/05/14	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee statement, Peck questions	0.04	0.03	0.03		
12/08/14	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee statement	0.01	0.01			
12/10/14	email w/Geesman re: PG&E ASLB update letter	0.04	0.04	0.04		
12/11/14	email w/Geesman re: NRC letter on site response and IPRP				0.07	
12/12/14	email w/Geesman re: DCNPP and CZMA			0.03		
12/16/14	email w/Geesman re: FOE FOIA materials, NRC, CCSIP report	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02	



12/17/14	email w/Geesman re: Peck DPO and CCCSIM timing, Peck retract	0.03	0.02	0.02	0.03	
12/23/14	email w/Geesman re: Uselding post on NRC website + CCSIM timelines		0.11	0.11	0.11	
12/17/14	review IPRP report #8 w/ notes; forward to Blakeslee + Hamilton	0.3	0.5		0.3	
12/25/14	review FOE FOIA materials from NRC	0.2	0.2	0.15	0.25	
12/25/14	email w/Geesman re: questions deriving from FOE FOIA	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	
01/07/15	TRAVEL SLO-Atherton (for IPRP meeting on 1/8/15)					4
01/08/15	meet w/Geesman + Hamilton to discuss IPRP strategy	0.13	0.12	0.12	0.13	
01/08/15	attend and make videotape record of IPRP meeting @ CPUC in SF	0.61	0.6	0.6	0.61	
01/09/15	edit excerpt Abrahamson Tornado Chart from IPRP video-distribute					0.4
01/13/15	conference callw/Blakeslee re: recap of IPRP #9 + strategy	0.15	0.15		0.15	
01/12/15	email w/Geesman re: IPRP video	0.01	0.01	0.01		
01/13/15	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee seismic materials	0.02	0.02	0.02		
01/16/15	phone call from Hamilton: suggests contactin expert Max Wyss		0.25			0.25
01/26/15	prepare documents + research forBlakeslee re: IPRP and AB 1632	0.75	0.25			0.25
01/30/15	email w/Geesman re: Anne Kammerer	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
01/31/15	email w/Geesman re: Peevey-Cherry emails on DCNPP licenses	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1	
02/02/15	download CPUC emails released through FOIA	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	
02/02/15	email w/Blakeslee re: CPUC release of emails					0.08
02/03/15	email w/Geesman re: tornado chart from DCISC mtg+ CPUC email	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	
02/03/15	edit/transcribe excerpt 10/14/14 DCISC meet of Tornado plot discussion	0.4	0.4			
02/04/14	strategy meeting w/Geesman + Becker	0.38	0.37	0.37	0.38	
02/03/15	research + locate 2010 Enercon DCNPP Balance of Plant study Blakeslee		0.4		0.3	
02/04/15	attend and participate in DCISC meeting	1.13	1.12	1.12	1.13	
02/05/15	email w/Geesman re: ex parte communication, Kammerer	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
02/06/15	excerpt, edit + upload relevant DCISC video highlights for Geesman	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	
02/06/15	email w/Geesman re: DCISC video clips	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
02/07/15	continued review of released CPUC-PGE emails	0.75	0.75	0.75	0.75	
02/07/15	email w/Geesman re: DCNPP economics, DCISC	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
02/08/15	email w/Geesman re: PG&E emails, Peevey event	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
02/10/15	email w/Blakeslee re: timing of release of IPRP report 9	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
02/10/15	email w/Blakeslee re: provide him database of PGE emails released	0.02	0.02			
02/11/15	email w/Blakeslee re: finding of redacted Sewell Tsunami report	0.01	0.01	0.01		
02/11/15	email w/Blakeslee on NRC internal talking point chronology	0.02	0.02		0.02	
02/11/15	correspondence w. clients re: Peevey, NRC communications plan	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
02/12/15	email w/Geesmans re: Hodin's take on Abrahamson + Peevey	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
02/13/15	email w/Geesman re: Peevey, Abrahamson video satire	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
02/17/15	email w/Geesman re: redaction, Blakeslee disgust at Seismic Studies	0.01	0.01			0.08
02/18/15	email w/Geesman re: redactions					0.02

02/20/15	email w/Geesman re: Hirsch critique of IPRP	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
02/22/15	email w/Geesman re: DCISC and NRC redacted comm. Plan	0.02	0.02	0.01	0.02		
02/24/15	email w/Geesman re: Picker interview, Sewell report	0.04	0.05	0.05	0.03		
03/01/18	edit Abrahamson seismic comment video compliation		1.2				
03/02/15	email w/Geesman re: NRC OIG investigation, Abrahamson video	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
03/02/15	phone call w/Geesman re: NRC OIG investigation	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		
03/03/15	correspondence w. clients re: NRC OIG investigation	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
03/06/15	review IPRP Report #9; comments to Geesman and Blakeslee	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		
03/06/15	email w/Geesman re: IPRP Report #9	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
03/07/15	email w/Geesman re: Hamilton/Weisman visit to DCNPP	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
03/08/15	email w/Geesman re:Hirsch hypothesis, Eric Greene	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
03/09/15	email w/Geesman re: response to PG&E's SSHAC claims	0.03	0.03	0.03	0.03		
03/10/15	email w/Geesman re: PG&E testimony, Abrahamson video	0.01	0.01				
03/12/15	email w/Blakeslee re: review of ASLB licensing basis and video links	0.01	0.02		0.02		
03/13/15	email w/Geesman re: OIG investigation, SSHAC response	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
03/18/15	email w/Geesman re: SSHAC tsunami omissions + Sewell report doc.	0.02	0.02		0.02		
03/18/15	email w/Blakeslee: send links to SSHAC report download site	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
03/19/15	review SWUS GMC Report	1.5	1.5	1.5	1.5		
03/20/15	review PG&E SSC SSHAC Report	2	2	2	2		
03/16/15	email w/Geesman re: reaction to FOE/Hirsch on seismic coverup		0.1	0.1			
03/18/15	email w/Geesman re: tsunami analysis, SSHAC video, ERRA Protest	0.04	0.08	0.08			
03/21/15	email w/Geesman re: SSHAC video; resspose of Supervisor Gibson	0.02	0.02				
03/21/15	email w/Geesman re: Blakesless Testimony requests	0.03	0.03	0.02			
03/22/15	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee Testimony concerns	0.03	0.03	0.03			
03/24/15	review + analyze IPRP report #9	0.3	0.2	0.2			
03/24/15	email w/Geesman re: Lochbaum answers on LBVP		0.03	0.01			
03/27/15	email w/Geesman re: should Hamilton participate in ERRA Testimony?	0.08	0.08		0.08		
03/30/15	review Draft Protest sent by Geesman	0.75	0.75	0.75	0.75		
03/31/15	email w/Geesman re: critiques of PGE misrepresenatation of AB 1632	0.06	0.04	0.04	0.04		
03/31/15	email w/Geesman re: Coastal Commission requirements re: CZMA dates			0.1			
04/01/15	draft email to Supervisor Mecham, SLO, re: PG&E scheduling timeline	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		
04/01/15	email w/Geesman re: Supervisor Mecham-Barry Allen correspondence	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
04/10/15	email w/Geesman re: Sewell Tsunami report, Comm. Picker	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
04/15/15	download + edit relevant video clips of Sen. Boxer hearing for Geesman	0.15	0.15		0.15		
04/15/15	email w/Blakeslee re: timing on release of AB 1632 report	0.01	0.01	0.01			
04/15/15	email w/Blakeslee re: Commissioner Florio statement re: FOE Petition	0.06	0.06	0.06			
04/20/15	email w/Geesman re: PGE response to A4NR data request 8 re: Sewell	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
04/20/15	phone conference w/Blakeslee: update on Seismic Study report failures	0.11	0.11	0.11			

04/20/15	email w/Blakeslee re: discovery of earlier Dickinson seismic report 2005	0.01	0.01	0.01		
04/22/15	review + analyze PGE reply to IPRP reports 7-8-9	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2	
04/22/15	email w/Geesman re: provide my critique of IPRP reports 7-8-9	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
04/22/15	email w/Blakeslee re: transmittal of PGE replies to IPRP reports 7-8-9	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
04/23/15	review Sam B. letter re: IPRP + link to PGE IPRP refutation	0.15	0.15	0.15	0.15	
04/23/15	email w/Geesman re: redacted tsunami report by Sewell outreach	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
04/23/15	review + analyze Sam Blakeslee report on PGE AB 1632 study	0.3	0.3	0.3	0.3	
04/24/15	email w/Blakeslee re: Absence of Chris Wills' critique in IPRP replies	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
04/27/15	attend CEC IEPR workshop on DCNPP seismic studies in Sacramento	0.78	0.78	0.78	0.78	
04/26/15	TRAVEL SLO-SACRAMENTO TO meet w/regulators					5
04/27/15	meeting w/ D. Lochbaum, John Laird, and Geesman in Sacramento	0.11	0.1	0.1	0.11	
04/28/15	meeting w/ D. Lochbaum, Ed Randolph, and Geesman @ CPUC San Fran	0.17	0.17	0.17	0.16	
04/29/15	TRAVEL SF to SLO from meeting at CPUC					4
04/30/15	email w/Geesman re: CZMA permits + relicensing schedule delays			0.2		
04/30/15	email w/Geesman re: how was PGE \$85 license renewal to be spent?					0.05
04/30/15	research + send Geesman PG&E details analysis of license renewal costs					0.75
05/07/15	email w/Geesman re: PGE non-response to A4NR data request	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/07/15	prepare + finalize Geesman draft of A4NR IEPR comments on letterhead	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/07/15	email w/Geesman re: Elmo Collins work for PGE re: AB1632 study	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/07/15	conference call w/Hamilton re: Gibson notices missing Hosgri images	0.25	0.25			
05/11/15	email w/Blakeslee re: CEC IEPR, letter, PGE ERRA testimony	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05	
05/13/15	email w/Blakeslee re: NRC IEPR presentation; PRA schedule, IPRP report	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
05/14/15	email w/Geesman re: point out errors in Transcript of PHC					0.02
05/14/15	review transcript of PHC in ERRA proceeding					0.5
05/19/15	email w/Dick Meehan re: seismic history, Max Wyss, provide documents	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.06	
05/19/15	email w/Blakeslee re: PGE receiving industry award for seismic study	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/19/15	email w/Geesman re: Dick Meehan as potential witness	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/20/15	edit + send video clip of Marcia McLaren on Shoreline fault to Geesman		0.5			
05/20/15	meeting w/Geesman re: Strategy session	0.42	0.42	0.42	0.41	
05/21/15	email w/Blakeslee re: FOE granted ASLB hearing--implications for CPUC	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/22/15	meeting w/Blakeslee re: describe role and duty in providing Testimony	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25	
05/22/15	email w/Geesman re: recap meeting w/Blakeslee re: his Testimony	0.02	0.01	0.02	0.02	
05/22/15	email w/Geesman re: analysis of coverage of USGS multiple ruptures	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01	
05/29/15	email w/Blakeslee re: summary of NRC meeting notes on PGE study	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	
06/06/15	download and sort all PGE emails related to A4NR data requests	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5	
06/02/15	write 1st draft of Rochelle Becker declaration re: Elmo Collins statement	1	1	1	1	
06/03/15	write final draft of Rochelle Becker declaration re: Elmo Collins	0.15	0.15	0.15	0.15	
06/03/15	email w/Geesman re: draft of Becker declaration re: Howell comment	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02	

06/04/15	email w/Geesman re: corrections to Becker declaration + Blakeslee	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		
06/01/15	email w/Blakeslee re: sorting PGE email responses to A4NR data request	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
06/03/15	phone conference w/Hamilton re: relevant data request emails for him	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		
06/09/15	email w/Geesman requesting factual review of Becker declaration	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
06/09/15	factual review of Becker declaration; final proof reading per Geesman	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
06/09/15	phone call to Chip Cameron, NRC, to confirm declaration accuracy	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.06		
06/15/15	review + sort PGE Data Request emails for relevance to Blakeslee	1	1	1	1		
06/15/15	meet w/Geesman in SLO for strategy session	0.38	0.38	0.37	0.37		
06/16/15	attend and participate in DCISC meeting	0.79	0.79	0.79	0.79		
06/17/15	attend and participate in DCISC meeting	2.88	2.88	2.87	2.87		
06/18/15	prepare DVD disc with relevant Data Responses for Hamilton + mail him	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		
06/18/15	email w/Geesman re: DVD files for Hamilton	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
06/18/15	prepare video excerpts of DCISC critique of Blakeslee--email to Blakeslee	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		
06/18/15	email w/Blakeslee re: DCISC critique of Blakeslee	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
06/19/15	email chain w/Geesman, Budnitz + Peck re: Probabilistic quake risk	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
06/19/15	email w/Blakeslee re: provide him selected emails from data responses	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		
06/28/15	email w/Meehan re: documents for possible witness participation	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		
06/29/15	emails w/Geesman re: testimony of Blakeslee + data response evidence	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
06/29/15	review + proof read Geesman Testimony	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		
06/30/15	review NRC SPID documents re: limited seismic data points, to Geesman	0.04	0.04	0.04	0.04		
06/30/15	emails w/Geesman re: Witness Ferre and NRC inspector Peck	0.02	0.02		0.02		
07/01/15	revise + edit Blakeslee Testimony draft	0.5	0.5	0.5	0.5		
07/02/15	emails w/Geesman re: Use of Hamilton Testimony + Blakeslee schedule	0.02	0.08	0.04			
07/02/15	revise + edit Blakeslee Testimony draft	1	1	1	1		
07/03/15	emails w/Geesman re: Hamilton models for Testimony consideration	0.02	0.02	0.02			
07/03/15	Phone conference w/Hamilton re: Southweset vs Northeast modeling	0.15	0.15	0.15			
07/06/15	revise + edit Blakeslee Testimony draft--near final sent to Geesman	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25		
07/07/15	email revised Blakeslee Testimony w/citations + email evidence included	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
07/08/15	email w/Blakeslee re: his comments on my edits to his testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
07/09/15	revise + edit Hamilton Testimony additions	0.5	0.75	0.5	0.5		
07/09/15	emails w/Geesman re: Hamilton testimony revisions	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		
07/10/15	emails w/Geesman re: Hamilton + Blakeslee testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
07/13/15	email w/Blakeslee re: deadlines for testimony revisions	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
07/13/15	revise, proof and edit Blakeslee Testimony	1	1	1	1		
07/14/15	final edit + format Blakeslee Testimony	1.25	1.25	1.25	1.25		
07/15/15	email w/Blakeslee--transmit copy of Geesman testimony	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
07/16/15	research, locate + study DCNPP Plant Betterment Study re: Lic. Renewal	0.15	0.15	0.15	0.15		
07/30/15	email w/Geesman re: NRC related emails on timing of CCCSIP release	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		

08/03/15	email w/Blakeslee re: Testimony + validation thru PGE data responses	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
08/03/15	email w/Geesman re: PG&E data responses, IPRP, DCISC + Meehan		0.01	0.01	0.01		
08/13/15	emails w/Geesman + Blakeslee re: magnitude saturation result flaws	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		
08/29/15	review NRC RAIs	0.04					
08/29/15	emails w/Geesman re: surrebuttal testimony deadline; cross exams	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
08/31/15	email w/Blakeslee re: NRC RAIs; cross examination cancelled	0.02	0.02	0.02	0.02		
08/31/15	emails w/Geesman re: NRC RAIs + Blakeslee responses	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		
09/09/15	email w/Blakeslee re: PGE use of indirect measurements vs. boreholes	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
09/08/15	TRAVEL SLO-SJC (stay in Atherton)					4	
09/09/15	meet w/Geesman + Doug Hamilton re: IPRP issue	0.32	0.31	0.31	0.31		
09/09/15	attend and make videotape record of IPRP meeting at CPUC in SF	0.63	0.62	0.62	0.63		
09/09/15	post-IPRP strategy meeting with Geesman + Hamilton	0.15	0.14	0.14	0.15		
09/10/15	TRAVEL SF to SLO after IPRP meeting					4	
09/11/15	edit + upload IPRP video to web for Geesman to review; email links	0.25	0.25	0.25	0.25		
09/18/15	email w/Geesman re: Blakeslee submittal, ERRA timeline, study results	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
09/22/15	research archive + locate FOIA regarding Dr. Peck, CCCSIP release timing	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
09/22/15	email w/Geesman re: FOE FOIA materials from NRC re: CCCSIP	0.05	0.05	0.05	0.05		
09/29/15	email w/Blakeslee re: PG&E timeline for relicensing effort at NRC	0.06	0.06	0.06	0.07		
10/07/15	review + proof read Geesman Opening Brief	0.2	0.2	0.2	0.2		
10/07/15	email w/Geesman re: transmit proofing corrections to Opening Brief	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
10/20/15	proof read + review A4NR Reply Brief	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
10/22/15	email w/Blakeslee re: thoughts on Geesman Opening Brief + NRC vs FOE	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
10/26/15	review PG&E Reply Brief	0.08	0.08	0.06	0.08		
10/26/14	email w/Blakeslee re: PG&E's critique of Blakeslee in Reply Brief	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
11/04/15	email w/Blakeslee + Geesman re: Kappa Values + Sammons graph	0.01	0.01	0.01	0.01		
12/04/15	review IPRP report #10	0.1	0.1	0.1	0.1		
	<b>David Weisman TOTALS</b>	38.63	43.39	38.59	36.18	28.12	<b>184.91</b>
	<b>Travel Hours</b>				<b>24.5</b>		
	<b>2014 Hours</b>	7.52	10.17	9.2	7.14	4.72	<b>38.75</b>
	<b>2015 Hours</b>	31.11	33.22	29.39	29.04	23.4	<b>146.16</b>

